2855 COLONIAL BLVD. | FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

SOLICITATION & TITLE: PETROLEUM PRODUCTS BID No. B187333RC AWARDED VENDORS:
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION 'VENDOR(S) NOTIFIED: 18
SUBMITTALS RECEIVED: 6
BOARD APPROVED DATES: July 1, 2023 - June 30, 2024 NO BID: 1
NON RESPONSES: 11
Vendors

Best Line Oil Company, Inc.
219-N 20th St
Tampa, FL 33605

808 NW 12th St.
Belle Glade, FL 33430

Howell Oil Company, Inc.

Newsom Oil Company
1702 Atlanta Ave.
Orlando, FL 32806

On-Site Antifreeze Recycling, LLC.

PO Box 3058

North Fort Myers, FL 33918

Palmdale Oil Company
911 N. 2nd St
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

Preventative Maintenance

of Florida, Inc.

5441 Lee Street #3
Lehigh Acres, FL 33971-1555

Wallace International Truck, Inc.
2761 Edison Ave.
Fort Myers, FL 33916

Phone: 813-248-1044 Phone: 561-996-2787

Phone: 813-352-4312

Phone: 800-872-9185

Phone: 772-461-2300

Phone: 877-770-7670

Phone: 239-334-1000

239.337.8523 Fax: Fax: 561-992-9156 Fax: N/A Fax: 239-995-0845 Fax: 772-595-0843 Fax: 877-770-7670 Fax:
RELEASED: March 26, 2018
REVISED: June 12, 2023 Email: larry.mcgary@ il.com  |Email: jared@howelloil.com |Email: bandrews@newsomoiicompany.com __|Emai: com Email: sbenni il.com Email: om Email:

ITEM BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND
M
NO. DESCRIPTION ol DID NOT RENEW Nlieee PRICE NOSER PRICE NUMBER PRICE DID NOT RENEW NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE
MOTOR OIL: 15W~40 KAPPA PREMIUM )
1.a |OR APPROVED EQUAL -BULK 250 GAL. ETSEOZ?R Lubriguard HD 15W40 CK-4 |  $5.84 U"'::v';:")‘i:;"'e $7.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MINIMUM-TANK LOTS :
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPA PREMIUM |PRICE PER UltraGuard Amalie
. i . . BID
1B |oR APPROVED EQUAL - 55 GAL. DRUM |GALLON: EEEREDEINEES | 630 15W40CK4D SL20 No NOBID NoBID
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPA PREMIUM )
1.c |OR APPROVED EQUAL-1GALLON  |PRICEPER Lubriguard HD 15W40 Ck-4 | $10.40 uiizeCusrd Amalic $7.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALLON: 15W40CK4G
CONTAINER
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPA PREMIUM |PRICE PER ) UltraGuard Amalie
1.d OR APPROVED EQUAL QUART: Lubriguard HD 15W40 CK-4 $2.94 T $2.50 NO BID NOBID NO BID
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC
OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ-4 |PRICE PER UltraGuard Petro Canada
. i : . NO BID NO BID NO BID
1-€ | OR APPROVED EQUAL BULK 250 GAL. |GALLON: EERIEEREETED || S SWAOFSHDB GFBED
MINIMUM-TANK LOTS
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC
1.f |OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ4 ETSEOZ?R Lubriguard HD FS 5W40 | $11.15 U'""Gs“““”:u';::;sa"“"“ $15.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
OR APPROVED EQUAL 55 GAL. DRUM :
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC
OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ-4 |PRICE PER ) UltraGuard Petro Canada
1.9 OR APPROVED EQUAL 1 GALLON GALLON: Lubriguard HD FS 5W40 $19.23 ST $15.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC
1.h |OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ4 :ﬁf:T'?ER NO BID U"'"Gs“:;:o';::; Caracs $5.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
OR APPROVED EQUAL : Q
PRICE PER UltraGuard Santex
2.a |GEAR LUBRICANT: GL 535 # PAIL POUND. Lubriguard 85W140GL5 | $1.26 85W140p $2.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
) **Supersedes MIL-1-2105C
UltraGuard Santex
2.b ﬁ::Relr-sl:?:Iscn:lf& S:;:cﬂn #DRUM ::'S:DF..ER Lubriguard 85W140 GL-5 $1.41 85W140D120 $2.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID
P : **Supersedes MIL-1-2105C
PRICE PER UltraGuard Santex
: i E . . NO BID NO BID
2.c |GEARLUBRICANT: GL5400#DRUM | S0 ™ Lubriguard 85W140GL'5 | $1.04 B s1.24 o o NO BID
PRICE PER UltraGuard Pure Guard
: i - . . NO BID NO BID
3.a |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: TUBE TuBE: Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease | $2.20 iy $2.93 o o NO BID
PRICE PER UltraGuard Pure Guard
) i - . y NO BID NO BID BID
3.b |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: 250r 35# PAIL. |00 Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease | $2.30 A o $2.96 o o NO BI
PRICE PER UltraGuard Pure Guard
) i - . . NO BID NO BID BID
3.c |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: 120#DRUM | S0 ™ Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease | $2.28 e $3.20 o o NO BI
PRICE PER UltraGuard Pure Guard
: i - . . BID NO BID
3.d |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: 400 # DRUM POUND. Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease |  $2.21 s o $2.95 NO o8BI NO BID
PRICE PER UltraGuard Pure Guard
: i - . . NO BID BID
4 | WHEEL BEARING GREASE: 120 # DRUM | -0 0 Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease | $2.28 i $3.20 o NOBI NO BID
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, )
5.a |SYNTHETIC, TRANSYND OR APPROVED ETSEOZ?R Lubriguard HD FS ATF $26.05 U'":f:;;‘;;’;‘“"e $16.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EQUAL - 1 GALLON CONTAINER :
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, -
5.b |SYNTHETIC, TRANSYND OR APPROVED [P % PER Coastal FS MV AT $810 UltraGuard Amalie s‘::-::/f)" NO BID NO BID NO BID
EQUAL - 55 GAL. DRUM : SLIE
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID,
SYNTHETIC, TRANSYND OR APPROVED |PRICE PER UltraGuard Amalie
5.C |COUAL . BULK 250 GAL. MIN.TANK | GALLON: Coastal FS MV ATF $7.65 Aaraosren $8.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

LOTS
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ITEM BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND
NO. DESCRIPTION uom DID NOT RENEW Nlieee PRICE NUoee PRICE NUMBER PRICE DID NOT RENEW NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE
— —
ANTIWEAR HYDRAULIC FLUID- ISO
VISCOSITY GRADE 68, FINAHYDRON  |PRICE PER UltraGuard Amalie
. i i b ! NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |OR APPROVED EQUAL - 55 GALLON | GALLON: (RIS | €2 HYDRAW6SD 2
ove N N
POWER STEERING FLUID: ROCKFORD- |PRICE PER ) UltraGuard Amalie
y ; NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |NPSF (L-4338-A) OR APPROVED EQUAL. |QUART: AEATERIRESEG | 2D Johnsen's 4610 Q 2 o o o
ANTIFREEZE: EXTENDED LIFE, 50/50 P Rudson - Diesel Heavy Duty
8.a |CONCENTRATE R Prestone HDELCS0/50 |  $6.75 u"’ii‘:;:[:&::*;;’/“;;“’" $11.50 NO BID Antifreeze 50/50 827 NO BID
1 GALLON CONTAINER : E E #AFC0301
ANTIFREEZE: EXTENDED LIFE, 50/50 o Rudson - Diesel Heavy Duty
8.b [CONCENTRATE ETSEOZ?R Prestone HD ELC 50/50 $6.20 U"'::“)‘;;‘I’E‘I‘;‘::;:/’:sg'e"’ 53:77::/?' Gly-Cool HD Ext. Life $6.40 Antifreeze 50/50 $8.10 NO BID
55 GALLON DRUM : +75/Brum #AFCO355
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF): 32.5%
9.a |UREA, 67.5% DE-IONIZED WATER. e R W Ultrapure DEF e $175 NO BID W NO BID NO BID
275 GALLON TANKS ONSITE :
$2.53
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF): 32.5%
9.b |UREA, 67.5% DE-IONIZED WATER. R NO BID iy $7.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GALLON CONTAINER :
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS PRICE PER UltraGuard Amalie
10 REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE |1 o1 e as shown
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS
11 |REQUIRED NO LATER THANBIDDUE | ACE PER Lrussusd hito Cansad as shown
DATE GALLON: 5W40 Full Syn
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLEIS | oo UltraGuard Amalie
12 |REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE  |F51°F T Full Syn ATF as shown
DATE : 295 type
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS traGuard Amatie
12.a [REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE as shown 0 %
DATE
13 |BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT % % % % NO BID

PER THE TERMS AND CC

OF THIS ITB, IT IS RECO

THIS BID BE AWARDED TO HOWELL OIL COMPANY,INC. AND NEWSOM OIL COMPANY

MEETING SPECIFICATIONS AT THE LOWEST COST AND THE BEST VALUE TO THE DISTRICT. BEST LINE OIL COMPANY, INC. AND PALMDALE OIL COMPANY DID NOT

RENEW.

APPROVED BY:

Aedars (g

RICHARD COWIE | PROCUREMENT AGENT

DATE:

BID TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER &
DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).

3-May-18
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