
Product Brand Name Case Size Unit Size Unit Cost Product Brand Name Case Size Unit Size Unit Cost

1. Gluten Free Sliced White Sandwich Bread Rudi's Bakery 8 18oz $7.09 Rudi's Bakery 8 18oz $7.59

2. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns Udi's Bakery 8 10.4oz $5.26 Udi's Bakery 8 10.4oz $5.59

3. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns Udi's Bakery 6 14.4oz $5.83 Udi's Bakery 6 12.9oz $6.31

4. Gluten Free Tortillas or Wraps,
Mission or Equivalent

Rudi's Bakery 12 9oz $7.36 La Tortilla Factory 6 13.96oz $7.11

5. Gluten Free Sliced Rice Bread
Food for Life or Equivalent

Food for Life 6 24oz $7.49 Food for Life 6 24oz $10.31

6. Gluten Free & Dairy Free Sliced Cheese, Cheddar Daiya Foods 8 7.8oz $4.91 Daiya Foods 8 7.8oz $5.19

7. Gluten Free & Dairy Free Shredded Cheese, Cheddar Daiya Foods 12 7.1oz $4.92

Gluten Free & Dairy Free Shredded Cheese, Mozzarella Daiya Foods 12 7.1oz $4.92 Daiya Foods 12 7.1oz $5.27

8. Gluten Free Breakfast Cereal, Variety of Flavors
Organic Choco Chimps Cereal 

Chocolate,
Envirokidz

12 10oz $5.13 
Organic Gorilla Munch Original,

Envirokidz
12 10oz $6.47 

9. Gluten Free English Muffins, Variety of Flavors
Traditional,
Kinnikinnick

6 12.5oz $5.25
Original,

Food for Life
6 18oz $8.79

10. Gluten Free Bagels, Variety of Flavors 
Plain,

Udi's Bakery
8 13.9oz $6.06

Plain,
Schar

4 14.1oz $7.75

Gluten Free Bagels, Variety of Flavors 
Cinnamon Raisin,

Udi's Bakery
8 13.9oz $6.06

Cinnamon Raisin 
Schar

4 14.1oz $7.75

11. Gluten Free Muffins, Variety of Flavors 
Blueberry,
O'Doughs

6 11.9oz $5.10 
Blueberry,

Veggies Made Great
8 12oz $7.83

Gluten Free Muffins, Variety of Flavors 
Chocolate,
O'Doughs

6 12oz $5.10 
Chocolate, 

Veggies Made Great
8 12oz $7.83

12. Gluten Free Crackers, Cheddar & Original 
Farmhouse Cheddar,

Simple Mills
6 4.25oz $4.79

Gluten Free Crackers, Cheddar & Original 
Fine Ground Sea Salt,

Simple Mills
6 4.25oz $4.79

Table Style Cracker,
Glutino

12 7oz. $4.79

Gluten Free Crackers, Cheddar & Original 
Entertainment,

Schar
5 6.2oz $4.79

13. Gluten Free Graham Crackers, Variety of Flavors
 Honey Graham,

Pamela's
6 7.5oz $6.42

 Honey Graham,
Pamela's

6 7.5oz $7.51

Gluten Free Graham Crackers, Variety of Flavors
Cinnamon Graham,

Pamela's
6 7.5oz $6.42

Cinnamon Graham,
Pamela's

6 7.5oz $7.51
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14. Gluten Free Cookies, Variety of Flavors
Chocolate Chip,

Kinnikinnick
6 8oz $4.02 

Chocolate Chip,
Kinnikinnick

6 8oz $4.31

Gluten Free Cookies, Variety of Flavors
 Chocolate Vanilla Crème,

Glutino
12 10.5oz $4.96 

 Chocolate Vanilla Crème,
Glutino

12 10.5oz $5.51

Gluten Free Cookies, Variety of Flavors
Vanilla Crème,

Glutino
12 10.5oz $4.96 

Vanilla Crème,
Glutino

12 10.5oz $5.51

15. Gluten Free Pasta, Spaghetti, 
Barilla or Approved Equivalent

Rummo 12 12oz $3.21 Barillla 12 12oz $3.44 

16. Gluten Free Pasta, Elbow Macaroni, 
Barilla or Approved Equivalent 

Barilla 8 2oz $3.63 

17. Gluten Free Waffles, Homestyle
Kashi or Approved Equivalent

Nature's Path 12 7.4oz $3.77 Nature's Path 12 7.4oz $4.39

Gluten Free Waffles, Chocolate Chip Nature's Path 12 7.4oz $3.77 Nature's Path 12 7.4oz $4.39

18. Gluten Free Pancakes, Buttermilk Pancake Bites Feel Good Foods 8 12.7oz $8.09

Gluten Free Pancakes, Wildberry Pancake Bites Feel Good Foods 8 12.7oz $8.09

19. Soy Milk, Vanilla, 32 oz., Shelf Stable Westsoy 12 32oz $3.98 

20. Rice Milk, Vanilla, 32 oz., Shelf Stable Dream 12 32oz $4.05 Dream 12 32oz $4.39

21. Gluten Free Breakfast Bars, Apple Cinnamon Enjoy Life 6 8.8oz $5.58 Enjoy Life 6 8.8oz $6.39

Gluten Free Breakfast Bars, Chocolate Chip Banana Enjoy Life 6 8.8oz $5.58 

Gluten Free Breakfast Bars, Cocoa Loco Enjoy Life 6 5.75 $4.61 Enjoy Life 6 5.75oz $4.95

22. Gluten Free Pizza Crust, Personal Size
9" 2-pack,

Udi's Bakery
8 8oz $6.11

9" 2-pack
Udi's Bakery

8 8oz $6.63

23. Gluten Free Pizza
Thin Crust, Uncured Pepperoni,

Udi's Bakery
6 18.39oz $14.03

Thin Crust, Uncured Pepperoni
Udi's Bakery

6 18.36oz $16.70

24. Gluten Free & Dairy Free Pizza, 
Daiya or Equivalent 

Cheeze Lovers,
Daiya Foods

8 15.7oz $9.03 
Cheeze Lovers,

Daiya Foods
8 15.7oz $9.67

Gluten Free & Dairy Free Pizza, 
Daiya or Equivalent

Meatless Pepperoni,
Daiya Foods

8 15.7oz $9.03 
Meatless Pepperoni,

Daiya Foods
8 15.7oz $9.67

25. Gluten Free & Dairy Free Macaroni & Cheese
Daiya or Equivalent

Daiya Foods 8 10.6oz $4.70 Daiya Foods 8 10.6oz $5.19

26. Gluten Free Macaroni & Cheese
Kraft or Equivalent

Creamy Deluxe,
Annie's

12 11oz $6.07

Gluten Free Macaroni & Cheese
Kraft or Equivalent

Shelf Stable,
Annie's (Cheese Powder)

12 6oz $4.02
Shelf Stable,

Annie's (Cheese Powder)
12 6oz $4.63
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No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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27. Almond Milk, Original, 32 oz., Shelf Stable Almond Breeze 12 32oz $2.84 Blue Diamond 12 32oz $3.91

28. Almond Milk, Chocolate, 32 oz., Shelf Stable Almond Breeze 12 32oz $2.84 Blue Diamond 12 32oz $3.91

29. Almond Milk, Vanilla, 32 oz., Shelf Stable Almond Breeze 12 32oz $2.84 Blue Diamond 12 32oz $3.91

30. Gluten Free Chicken Nuggets 
Family Pack,

Ian's Natural Foods
8 20oz 10.91 Ian's Natural Foods 12 8oz $7.43

31. Gluten Free Chicken Tenders Applegate Farms 6 16oz $13.12 Bell & Evans 12 12oz $7.59

32. Gluten Free Mozzarella Sticks,
Feel Good Foods or Equivalent

Feel Good Foods 9 8oz $8.25 

33. Gluten Free Meatball Parmesan Calzones
Feel Good Foods or Equivalent

Feel Good Foods 9 8oz $8.25 

34. Dairy Free Yogurt (Almond or Soy), Strawberry
Almond Milk Strawberry,

Silk
8 5.30oz $2.34 

Dairy Free Yogurt (Almond or Soy), Vanilla
Almond Milk Vanilla,

Silk
8 5.30oz $2.34 

35. Gluten Free Fish Sticks
Family Pack,

Ian's Natural Foods
8 14oz $11.23

Family Pack,
Ian's Natural Foods

8 14oz $12.07

36. Gluten Free Corn Dogs Applegate Farms 12 10oz $8.61 Foster Farms 8 2lb $11.69 

37. Gluten Free Donuts, Powdered 
Katz or Equivalent

Katz 6 10.5oz $5.92 Katz 6 10.5oz $7.27

Gluten Free Donuts, Glazed
Katz or Equivalent

Katz 6 15.5oz $7.27

38.
Ready to Drink Twist & Go Gluten Free Smoothies - 7.6 oz
Minimum 4 oz yogurt - 1 MMA & ½ cup fruit juice; Variety of Flavors
Barfresh or Equivalent

39.
Chocolate Chickpea Spread, Nut Free, Gluten Free, Soy Free, Shelf 
Stable 1 MMA, 1.25 oz portion cups
The Amazing Chickpea or Equivalent

40. Other foods offered by the Vendor 
(Gluten Free, Soy Free, Dairy Free or Egg Free Items)

41. Percentage discount or markup of future foods offered.

DISCOUNT

0%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Not to Specification

No Bid

Items Offered Not Needed for Student Lunches  

MARKUP

10%

DISCOUNT

0%

MARKUP

10%



11 Secondary Vendor
2
9
0

Vendors notified of the ITB 
Vendors Submitted a Bid 
Vendors Non-Responsive 
Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid

Primary Vendor 

It is recommended that this ITB be awarded to Healthy Choice Markets, Inc.
dba Ada's Natural Market and Skinny Pantry Distributors, LLC, having submitted the lowest overall 
and best response meeting specifications.

DATE: July 3, 2023APPROVED BY: Joni Al-Shabibi
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