
ITEM
NO.

ITEM BEST AND FINAL RATE

1 Group Purchasing Organization (GPO) Annual Membership Fee $3,275.00

2
Total Group Purchasing Organization (GPO) Pricing of "Product Usage 
Form" $7,723,324.94

3 Fixed Fee Per Case for items listed on "Product Usage List Form" $2.60

4
Group Purchasing Organization (GPO) Potential Rebates and 
Incentives $300,000.00

AWARDED VENDOR - HPS, LLC

39 VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED
1 VENDORS SUBMITTED A RESPONSIVE PROPOSAL
1 VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO - BID

37 VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND

APPROVED BY: Joni Al-Shabibi 

NO BID

Food Supply and Distribution Service

HPS, LLC
Attn: Michelle Pleiness
3275 N M-37 Highway
Middleville, MI 49333

269-795-3308
mpleiness@hpsgpo.com

Interboro Packaging Corporation
Attn: Esty Werzbrger

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549
845-782-6800 Ext. 108

ew@interboropakaging.com

It is recommended that this ITN be awarded to HPS, LLC, being the highest ranked, best value firm(s) based on the 
evaluation committee ranking and negotiated pricing.

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

ITN No. N237435JA

OPENING DATE:  WEDNESDAY, March 29, 2023



Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Product Description
Product 
Packaging

Product Brand Manufacturer
Alternate & Equal Item 
Name & Mfgr.
(Enter only if proposing alternate product in this column)

Case Price 
(to 
Exclude 
Fixed Svc. 
Fees)

Totals 
July-Dec 
2022

TOTAL COST 
Case Price x 
Totals (Formula 
included)

16191 ANIMAL CRACKERS 185/1.1 OZ E * S FOODS E * S FOODS No Bid 300 -$                    
ASA10013 APPLESAUCE CINNAMON UNSWT 96/4.5 OZ PETERSON FARMS (FRUIT) PETERSON FARMS $34.05 2607 88,768.35$        
ASA10014 APPLESAUCE STRAWBERRY UNSWT 96/4.5 OZ PETERSON FARMS (FRUIT) PETERSON FARMS $34.25 1003 34,352.75$        
12042190895 BACON LAYFLAT C/C 14/18 APL GF 2/10 LB SYSCO CLASSIC FRESH MARK FOODS $52.34 50 2,617.00$          
01068 BACON LAYFLAT C/C 14/18 APL GF 2/10 LB SYSCO CLASSIC TYSON PREPARED FOODS 596321,BACON LAID-OUT 14/18 SLVR 15# FRML,Smithfield-Fa   $52.34 100 5,234.00$          
18000-38413 BAGEL STRAWBERRY MINI 72/2.43 OZ PILLSBURY BAKERIES GENERAL MILLS $31.80 3055 97,149.00$        
ZCH100 BAR NTRTNL COCOA CHERRY WG IW 120/1.8 OZ ZEE ZEES (LOGO) NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $43.00 2959 127,237.00$      
01619 BEAN BAKED BEAN POT BUSH 6/#10 BUSH BROTHERS BUSH BROS $44.02 1258 55,377.16$        
001885 BEAN BLACK LOW SODIUM 6/#10 BUSH BROTHERS BUSH BROS $30.47 891 27,148.77$        
74865-62811 BEAN GREEN CUT 1/30 LB SYSCO RELIANCE BONDUELLE CANADA 360191,BEAN GREEN CUT IQF 30# KE,LIMSON TRADING ,9390 $43.26 23 994.98$              
00001224510 BEAN GREEN CUT 4SV BL FCY 6/#10 SYSCO CLASSIC LAKESIDE FOODS 273856,BEAN GREEN CUT MXD SV 6-10 GCHC,LAKESIDE FOOD $45.62 448 20,437.76$        
74865-62810 BEAN GREEN CUT GR A 1/30 LB SYSCO CLASSIC VLM FOODS INC 285630,BEAN GREEN CUT IQF 30# GCHC,NORTERA FOODS US  $55.10 58 3,195.80$          
CNQ183003W BEEF PATTY CHARBROILED FC 180/3 OZ USDA FURTHER PROCESSED DON LEE FARMS 190952,BEEF PTY CHARB 180-3Z DON LEE FRMS,DON LEE FAR $56.03 1230 68,916.90$        
CN20401 BEEF PATTY CRUMBLE 284/2.2 OZ DON LEE FARMS DON LEE FARMS No Bid 103 -$                    
CP5249 BEEF TACO FLLNG 6/5 LB JTM JTM PROVISIONS COMPANY INC $122.45 100 12,245.00$        
112317000 BREAD CHS PULL APART CHS&GRLC 72/3.88 OZ PILLSBURY BAKERIES GENERAL MILLS $60.62 1814 109,964.68$      
54316720 BREAD PULLMAN WHEAT 28SLI 10/24 OZ BAKERSOURCE CLASSIC FLOWERS SPECIALTY 733391,BREAD WHLWHE PULLMAN SLCD 10-24Z,FLOWERS FO $20.54 402 8,257.08$          
7012 BREAD STICK GLAZED TWIN DUNKIN 60/3.2 OZ SUPER BAKERY SUPER BAKERY $25.81 2598 67,054.38$        
54333960 BREAD WHEAT DELI 8/24 OZ BAKERSOURCE CLASSIC FLOWERS SPECIALTY $27.36 81 2,216.16$          
17021081120 BREADSTICK CHEESE FILD 108/7 IN BOSCO'S PIZZA TYSON FOODS POULTRY DIV $47.24 1450 68,498.00$        
15021 BREADSTICK GARLIC WHL GRAIN 1/13.5 LB NEW YORK FROZEN FOODS NEW YORK FROZEN FOODS $31.85 575 18,313.75$        
15021 BREADSTICK GARLIC WHL GRAIN 1/13.5 LB NEW YORK FROZEN FOODS T MARZETTI CO $31.85 1400 44,590.00$        
087BC BREADSTICK PIZZA PPRNI 105/4.2 OZ BIG BAMBINO S&F FOODS INC $77.31 10 773.10$              
16000-45576 BREAKFAST BAR CINN TST CRNCH 96/1.42 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $29.08 2 58.16$                
3800035645 BREAKFAST BAR NUTRI-GRN APPLE 48/1.3 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $22.06 595 13,125.70$        
3800035745 BREAKFAST BAR NUTRI-GRN BLUBRY 48/1.3 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $22.06 1150 25,369.00$        
3800035845 BREAKFAST BAR NUTRI-GRN RASP 48/1.3 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $22.06 256 5,647.36$          
3800059772 BREAKFAST BAR NUTRI-GRN STWBRY 96/1.55 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $29.57 1728 51,096.96$        
3800035945 BREAKFAST BAR NUTRI-GRN STWBRY 48/1.3 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $22.06 1013 22,346.78$        
3800080801 BREAKFAST FRENCH TOAST MINICHO 72/3.03 OZ EGGO WAFFLES KELLOGG $41.38 3518 145,574.84$      
10520310 BUN HAMBURGER WHL WHT SLI 4IN 10/12 CT EUROPEAN BAKERS (FLOWERS) FLOWERS SPECIALTY No Bid 2435 -$                    
471 BUN HOT DOG WHL GRAIN 144/2 OZ BAKE CRAFTERS BAKE CRAFTERS FOOD COMPANY $32.58 1126 36,685.08$        
15839COM BUTTER-IT ALT LIQ ZTF 3/1 GAL SYSCO IMPERIAL CARGILL OIL 614640,BUTTER ALT LIQ NT 3-1GAL GCHC,Limson - Cargill, 921 $44.40 180 7,992.00$          
9074BC CALZONE CHEESE MINI 1/144 CT S&F FOODS S&F FOODS INC $39.06 5 195.30$              
16000-32262 CEREAL CHEERIOS GF BWLPK 96/1 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $24.31 1190 28,928.90$        
11941000 CEREAL CHEERIOS GLTN FR BWL 96/.688 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS No Bid 102 -$                    
16000-29444 CEREAL CINN TST RDUC SUG BWLPK 96/1 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $24.31 111 2,698.41$          
11815000 CEREAL CINNAMON TST CRUN BWLPK 96/1 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $24.31 626 15,218.06$        
16000-28932 CEREAL CINNAMON TST CRUN CUP 60/2 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $72.29 407 29,422.03$        
3800078788 CEREAL FROOT LOOP REDSUG INDIV 96/1 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $21.60 1621 35,013.60$        
16000-31917 CEREAL LUCKY CHARM GLTNFR BWL 96/1 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $24.31 1406 34,179.86$        
16000-31921 CEREAL RICE CHEX GLTN FR BWL 96/1 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $24.31 353 8,581.43$          
41749000034500 CHEESE MILD CHEDDAR SHRED 4/5 LB LAND O LAKES LAND O LAKES $106.91 1 106.91$              



59701000034500 CHEESE STRING MOZZ 168/1 OZ LAND O LAKES LAND O LAKES $79.98 3 239.94$              
23415 CHICKEN BNLS WING BRD WG 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS RICH CHICKS LLC $93.49 4125 385,646.25$      
10035220928 CHICKEN BRST FAJ STRIP GRL CN 6/5 LB TYSON FOODS TYSON FOODS POULTRY DIV $104.26 134 13,970.84$        
13443 CHICKEN BRST SEAS FIL WG FC 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS (CHICKNPATTY) RICH CHICKS LLC No Bid 1720 -$                    
0116 CHICKEN CHUNK CHRY BLSM 1/42 LB CHEFS CORNER CHEFS CORNER FOODS $163.55 210 34,345.50$        
0132 CHICKEN CHUNK GENERAL TSO 1/42 LB CHEFS CORNER CHEFS CORNER FOODS $154.41 367 56,668.47$        
16660100928 CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD FC 1/30 LB TYSON FOODS TYSON FOODS POULTRY DIV $85.50 3874 331,227.00$      
10000029054 CHICKEN JERKY SWT BBQ BITE 1OZ 1/48 CT JACKS LINKS (MEAT) DOT FOODS $34.56 75 2,592.00$          
10000029054 CHICKEN JERKY SWT BBQ BITE 1OZ 1/48 CT JACKS LINKS (MEAT) DOT FOODS $34.56 724 25,021.44$        
94403 CHICKEN MEAT POPPER WGN FC CN 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS RICH CHICKS LLC $96.49 825 79,604.25$        
54410 CHICKEN NUGGET BRD CKD 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS (CHICKNPATTY) RICH CHICKS LLC $73.62 2396 176,393.52$      
CRC54463 CHICKEN PTY BRD WHLGRN 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS (CHICKNPATTY) RICH CHICKS LLC $73.62 700 51,534.00$        
1260 CHICKEN STRIP FC OVEN RSTD 1/30 LB GOLDKIST PILGRIM'S PRIDE No Bid 2 -$                    
32405 CHIP CORN ORIG SS 104/1 OZ FRITOLAY FRITO LAY $32.35 18 582.30$              
32078 CHIP POTATO BAKED BBQ 60/.875 OZ BAKED LAYS FRITO LAY $18.79 1 18.79$                
33627 CHIP POTATO CRISP SRCRM ONION 60/.875 OZ BAKED LAYS FRITO LAY $18.79 136 2,555.44$          
36096 CHIP TORTILLA COOL RANCH RFAT 72/1 OZ DORITOS (FRITO LAY) FRITO LAY $22.62 177 4,003.74$          
47753 CHIP TORTILLA CRISPY ROUNDS 8/16 OZ TOSTITOS FRITO LAY $19.07 140 2,669.80$          
62829 CHIP TORTILLA FLAMAS RF 72/1 OZ DORITOS (FRITO LAY) FRITO LAY $28.20 148 4,173.60$          
31748 CHIP TORTILLA NACHO REDUCE FAT 72/1 OZ DORITOS (FRITO LAY) FRITO LAY $22.62 408 9,228.96$          
20871 CHIP TORTILLA RND 28/3 OZ TOSTITOS FRITO LAY $14.41 7 100.87$              
261194 CHIP TORTILLA ROUND YELLOW 60/2 OZ SNAK KING SNAK-KING CORP $18.33 4210 77,169.30$        
42537 CHIP TORTILLA SCOOPS BAKED 72/.875 OZ TOSTITOS FRITO LAY $20.29 4407 89,418.03$        
49093 CHIP TORTILLA SPY SWT CHL RFAT 72/1 OZ DORITOS (FRITO LAY) FRITO LAY $22.62 51 1,153.62$          
47752 CHIP TORTILLA WHT CORN 8/16 OZ SANTITAS FRITO LAY $16.28 80 1,302.40$          
3010040213 COOKIE ORIGINAL GRAHAM TIGER B 150/1 OZ KEEBLER KELLOGG $30.38 95 2,886.10$          
ES1001 COOKIE VAN FOOD NUTRITION 120/1 OZ DICK & JANE'S SYSCO SOUTHEAST CENTRAL WHSE $24.90 1170 29,133.00$        
20452 CORN DOG CHIC WHL GRN MINI .67 2/5 LB HOUSE OF REAFORD HOUSE OF RAEFORD $22.60 8 180.80$              
95150 CORN DOG CHKN L/F WHL GRAIN 72/4 OZ FOSTER FARMS FOSTER FARMS POULTRY $32.40 1179 38,199.60$        
74865-63319 CORN WHL KERNEL GR A 1/30 LB SYSCO CLASSIC BONDUELLE CANADA 264073,CORN CUT WHL KRNL A GRD F 1-20# P/L,Diversifood A $21.94 162 3,554.28$          
74865-63319 CORN WHL KERNEL GR A 1/30 LB SYSCO CLASSIC SENECA 264073,CORN CUT WHL KRNL A GRD F 1-20# P/L,Diversifood A $21.94 32 702.08$              
74865-07844 CORN WHL KERNEL GR A P 12/2.5 LB SYSCO CLASSIC BONDUELLE CANADA 610782,CORN CUT SWT 6-4# GCHC,LAKESIDE FOODS - FRZ,10 $41.38 545 22,552.10$        
2410079263 CRACKER CHEEZITS WHL GRAIN 175/.75 OZ SUNSHINE (KEEBLER) KELLOGG $40.51 2742 111,078.42$      
2.0014E+11 CRACKER GOLDFISH WHL GRAIN 300/.75 OZ PEPPRIDGE FARMS CAMPBELL SOUP COMPANY $60.69 1422 86,301.18$        
056070 CRACKER GRAHAM CHOC BELLY BEAR 200/1OZ MRS GOODCOOKIE BAKERY J&J SNACK FOODS $33.92 600 20,352.00$        
3010091822 CRACKER GRAHAM HNY W/CALCIUM 150/3 CT KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $32.89 1627 53,512.03$        
3010030074 CRACKER GRAHAM ORIG 200/2 CT KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $41.42 100 4,142.00$          
23445 CRANBERRY DRIED STWBRY CRAISIN 200/1.16OZ OCEAN SPRAY OCEAN SPRAY $46.60 2150 100,190.00$      
YS200SYS CUP PLAS PRTN TRANS 2OZ 12/200CT SYSCO RELIANCE PACTIV 795930,CUP PRTN SOUFF 2Z TRANSL 12-200CT,PACTIV EVERG    $31.33 1 31.33$                
2008 DESSERT CUP JOLY BERRY 84/4.4OZ SIDEKICKS COUNTRY PURE FOODS $28.87 731 21,103.97$        
19100 DONUT PLAIN WHL GRAIN IW CN 80/3 OZ SUPER BAKERY SUPER BAKERY $30.53 3 91.59$                
03853 DONUT RING JMBO UNGLZD 72/2.5 OZ RICH'S FOODS RICH FOODS No Bid 128 -$                    
10988 DOUGH ROLL DINNER WHL GRAIN 288/1.25OZ RICH'S FOODS RICH FOODS $27.43 400 10,972.00$        
85719685061 DRESSING BLUE CHEESE CUP 100/1.5 OZ NATURALLY FRESH BAY VALLEY FOODS $25.99 258 6,705.42$          
KE0665A5 DRESSING BLUE CHS CUPS 100/1.5OZ KEN'S KEN'S FOODS $31.22 155 4,839.10$          
81562 DRESSING ITALIAN FAT FREE PKT 204/12 GM T. MARZETTI T MARZETTI CO No Bid 161 -$                    
KE0026B3 DRESSING RANCH FTFR 60/1.5 OZ KEN'S KEN'S FOODS $17.79 88 1,565.52$          
KE0708A5 DRESSING RANCH LITE NAT 100/1.5 OZ KEN'S KEN'S FOODS $25.67 3775 96,904.25$        
10013000533109 DRESSING RANCH PACKET 200/12 GM HEINZ KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY $24.59 4 98.36$                
16002 DRINK BERRY BERRY BLUE 60/4 OZ COOL TROPICS SLUSH TROPICAL PARADISE INC $25.00 2517 62,925.00$        



01197 DUNKER BAR CHERRY APPLE CRUNCH 120/2.25 OZ THE FATHERS TABLE THE FATHERS TABLE $43.78 450 19,701.00$        
01186 DUNKER BAR LEMON CHIP CRUNCH 120/2.25 OZ THE FATHERS TABLE THE FATHERS TABLE $43.78 1020 44,655.60$        
01194 DUNKER BAR TRIPLE BERRY CRUNCH 120/2.25 OZ THE FATHERS TABLE THE FATHERS TABLE $43.78 1020 44,655.60$        
4521 DUTCH WAFFLE 51% WG 5" 48/5" DUTCH WAFFLE J&J SNACK FOODS $22.62 1410 31,894.20$        
72001 ENTREE CHICKEN TANGERINE W/SCE 6/7.15 LB ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS INC $172.00 830 142,760.00$      
99892 ENTREE MACARONI & CHEESE 4/5 LB TABATCHNICK TABATCHNICK FINE FOODS INC $48.99 1820 89,161.80$        
68523 FIESTADA 51% WG BEEF PIZZA 72/5 OZ TONY'S SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $49.72 1896 94,269.12$        
74865067997 FRANK ALL-BEEF 8X1 6 IN 2/5 LB BLOCK & BARREL IMPERIAL SMITHFIELD PACKGED MEATS SALE $31.00 194 6,014.00$          
437 FRANK BEEF 160/2 OZ KENT QUALITY (LOGO) KENT QUALITY FOODS INC $44.16 1997 88,187.52$        
1765 FRUIT CUP MIXED 72/4.5 OZ NATIONAL FOODS NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $51.00 1642 83,742.00$        
1780 FRUIT CUP PEAR DICED 72/4.5 OZ NATIONAL FOODS NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $52.07 2459 128,040.13$      
1765 FRUIT CUP, HARVEST MIXED FRUIT 72/4.5 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $51.00 570 29,070.00$        
1740 FRUIT CUP, PEACHES 72/4.5 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $51.10 660 33,726.00$        
1780 FRUIT CUP, PEARS, DICED 72/4.5 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $52.07 660 34,366.20$        
2014 JUICE CUP SLUSHIE KIWI-STRAW 84/4.4 OZ SIDEKICKS COUNTRY PURE FOODS $29.84 3981 118,793.04$      
10013000984802 KETCHUP PACKET FCY 1000/9 GM HEINZ KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY $18.09 2 36.18$                
REDY59G KETCHUP PACKET FOIL 1000/9 GM RED GOLD RED GOLD $21.84 350 7,644.00$          
REDYL9G KETCHUP PACKET NAT WITH SUGAR 1000/9 GM RED GOLD RED GOLD $25.31 1200 30,372.00$        
YLS2FRSYS LID PLAS CLR F/1.5-2.5OZ PRTN 24/100 CT SYSCO IMPERIAL PACTIV 518021,LID PRTN SOUFF .75/1Z CLR 25-100 GCHC,PACTIV EVE    $20.00 1 20.00$                
51666 LOAF APPLE CINN MINI IW 72/2 OZ MUFFINTOWN JSB INDUSTRIES $22.73 16615 377,658.95$      
10202 LUNCH KIT TRKY & CHS 48/4.38 OZ TASTY BRAND TASTY BRANDS LLC No Bid 1929 -$                    
209503 LUNCH MEAT TURKEY COMBO SLI 12/1 LB JENNIE-O JENNIE O FOODS $39.00 127 4,953.00$          
5768 MACARONI & CHS RDUC SOD 6/5 LB JTM JTM PROVISIONS COMPANY INC $50.73 2270 115,157.10$      
494874147002SY MAYONNAISE PKT FOIL 500/12 GM SYSCO CLASSIC KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY 852449,MAYONNAISE PKT 500-12GM HNZ,KRAFT HEINZ DRY  $45.02 801 36,061.02$        
91401 MEATBALL CHICKEN MOZZ FC 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS RICH CHICKS LLC $124.02 1545 191,610.90$      
92175 MIX GRAVY BRN 6/15 OZ SYSCO IMPERIAL PIONEER FLOUR MILLS 242450,GRAVY MIX BROWN 12-15Z GCHC,Diamond Crystal,57 $40.99 170 6,968.30$          
92061 MIX GRAVY CHICKEN 6/14 OZ SYSCO IMPERIAL PIONEER FLOUR MILLS 138440,GRAVY MIX CHIX RSTD 6-14Z PION,C H Guenther,9454 $25.46 153 3,895.38$          
09100 MUFFIN BLUEBERRY IW 96/2.25 OZ OTIS SPUNKMEYER OTIS SPUNKMEYER INC $48.28 254 12,263.12$        
10143 MUFFIN BLUEBERRY WG RF IW 72/2 OZ OTIS SPUNKMEYER OTIS SPUNKMEYER INC $31.65 3366 106,533.90$      
WG845 MUFFIN CHOC CHIP DOUBLE I/W 60/3.15OZ DAVE'S BAKING COMPANY DAVES BAKING $31.80 499 15,868.20$        
47036-SYS MUSTARD YELLOW PACKETS 1000/5.5 GMHOUSE RECIPE CLASSIC KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY $29.54 583 17,221.82$        
748651691500 MUSTARD YELLOW PACKETS 500/5.5 GM SYSCO CLASSIC KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY 771780,MUSTARD PKT 500-5.5GM PPI,KRAFT HEINZ DRY (JAC  $9.22 73 673.06$              
B60260 NUTRITION BAR BERRY APPLE CRISP WG 120/2.2 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $51.30 330 16,929.00$        
B60500 NUTRITION BAR BIRTHDAY CAKE 120/2.2 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $64.50 540 34,830.00$        
B60430 NUTRITION BAR CINNAMON CRISP WG 120/2.2 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC $51.30 406 20,827.80$        
B60480 NUTRITION BAR S'MORES RTE IW 120/2.2 OZ ZEE ZEES NATIONAL FOOD GROUP INC No Bid 540 -$                    
99955COM PAN COATING ARSL 6/17 OZ SYSCO CLASSIC CONAGRA GROCERY PRODUCTS 112828,PAN COAT SPRAY 6-17Z KE,PAR-WAY,1000004054 $21.41 240 5,138.40$          
3800092562 PANCAKE MAPLE MINIS 72/3.03OZ EGGO WAFFLES KELLOGG $40.67 5 203.35$              
10000070613 PANCAKE SAUSAGE STK TRKY WG IW 40/2.5 OZ JIMMY DEAN FOODS SARA LEE BAKERY $25.34 2538 64,312.92$        
1000440072 PASTA PENNE RIGATE 2/10 LB BARILLA ITALIAN PASTA BARILLA AMERICA $20.50 450 9,225.00$          
4831-071 PEPPERONI SLICED PORK&BF14-16C 1/10 LB ARREZZIO IMPERIAL TYSON PREPARED FOODS $37.81 233 8,809.73$          
68769-071 PEPPERONI SLICED PORK&BF14-16C 2/12.5 LB ARREZZIO IMPERIAL SMITHFIELD PACKGED MEATS SALE $96.50 6 579.00$              
63532 PIZZA CHEESE DEEP DISH 5IN IW 24/5.2 OZ LITTLE CHARLIE/TONY'S PZA SCHWANS FOODSERVICE No Bid 60 -$                    
60WGUM2 PIZZA CHEESE FRNCH GRLC WG 60/4.5 OZ NARDONE BROTHERS NARDONE BROTHERS BAKING PIZ $51.00 5 255.00$              
78637 PIZZA CHEESE PREM 16 CN 9/16 INCH BIG DADDYS PIZZA (SCHWAN) SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $66.36 2304 152,893.44$      
40WRMNY2 PIZZA CHEESE RND WW IW 5IN 40/5.35OZ NARDONE BROTHERS NARDONE BROTHERS BAKING PIZ $39.00 1925 75,075.00$        
63519 PIZZA CHEESE ROUND 5IN BULK 54/5.2 OZ TONYS (SCHWANS) SCHWANS FOODSERVICE No Bid 77 -$                    
78639 PIZZA CHICKEN BUFLO WHL GRAIN 9/16 IN BIG DADDY'S PIZZA SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $70.06 216 15,132.96$        
63527 PIZZA PEPPERONI RND 5IN WRPD 24/6.25OZ TONYS (SCHWANS) SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $27.50 135 3,712.50$          
16WSRFCTP2 PIZZA PEPPERONI TRKY 4CHS 8/43.57 OZ NARDONE BROTHERS NARDONE BROTHERS BAKING PIZ $61.00 1297 79,117.00$        



3800055122 POP TART FR CINN WHL GRN 1CT 120/1.69 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $38.80 1776 68,908.80$        
3800055130 POP TART FR STRWBRY WHL GR 1CT 120/1.69 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $38.80 1741 67,550.80$        
12307 PORK BBQ CHP TEXAS WESTERN CN 4/5 LB BROOKWOOD FARMS INC BROOKWOOD FARMS $69.78 850 59,313.00$        
CP5205 PORK MEAT TACO FLLNG RED FAT 6/5 LB JTM JTM PROVISIONS COMPANY INC $58.37 3223 188,126.51$      
LW585 POTATO DICED RSMARY GRLC RDSKN 6/2.5 LB LAMB WESTON LAMB WESTON $27.36 1740 47,606.40$        
1000007470 POTATO FRY CC 1/2 DEEP CUT 6/5 LB MCCAIN MC CAINS FOODS $38.99 2079 81,060.21$        
SYR00961 POTATO FRY KK 1/2 6/5 LB SYSCO RELIANCE MC CAINS FOODS 200697,FRIES 1/2" C/C OVEN 6-5# MCC,MCCAIN FOODS (ATLA  $27.54 481 13,246.74$        
OIF03456 POTATO FRY SMILE 6/4 LB MCCAIN MC CAINS FOODS $36.12 1983 71,625.96$        
1000004108 POTATO FRY SPIRAL SEASD BKABL 6/4 LB MCCAIN MC CAINS FOODS $31.84 800 25,472.00$        
MCF04566 POTATO FRY SWEET KK 7/16 6/2.5 LB MCCAIN MC CAINS FOODS $25.27 2200 55,594.00$        
OIF03613 POTATO MASHED HMSTY MASHMAKER 6/4 LB MCCAIN MC CAINS FOODS $44.58 925 41,236.50$        
78637 PRIMO 16" WG RISING CRUST 4 CHEESE PI9/16" BIG DADDY'S PIZZA SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $66.36 870 57,733.20$        
78639 PRIMO 16" WG RISING CRUST BUFFA CHIC9/16" BIG DADDY'S PIZZA SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $70.06 360 25,221.60$        
78638 PRIMO 16" WG RISING CRUST TURKEY PEP9/16" BIG DADDY'S PIZZA SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $68.96 870 59,995.20$        
AA20A0A3E060 RAISIN DRIED SR WTRMLN 250/1.03 OZ AMAZING RAISINS AMAZING FRUIT PRODUCTS-US LLC $73.75 750 55,312.50$        
3386581 RAISIN SEEDLESS DARK SEL 144/1.5 SYSCO IMPERIAL REMA FOODS INC 340701,RAISIN SEEDLESS 1.5Z 24-6CT BOGH,Boghosian Raisin $38.32 434 16,630.88$        
78001 RICE FRIED VEG 8/5 LB ASIAN STAR ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS INC No Bid 479 -$                    
54314820 ROLL SUB SLI 6 12/6 CT BAKERSOURCE CLASSIC FLOWERS SPECIALTY $26.65 75 1,998.75$          
4816271457 ROLL WHEAT WHL GRAIN 90/2 OZ SISTER SCHUBERT'S SISTER SCHUBERTS HMMADE ROLL $19.77 3 59.31$                
33631 ROLL WHITE DINNER CLSTR 1.25 12/16 CT BAKERSOURCE CLASSIC ALPHA BAKING CO INC $47.92 218 10,446.56$        
10013000528402 SALSA DIPPING CUP 60/2 OZ HEINZ KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY No Bid 40 -$                    
REDSC2ZC168 SALSA DIPPING CUP 3OZ 168/3 OZ RED GOLD RED GOLD $68.55 735 50,384.25$        
134000 SANDWICH CHEESE GLD WHL GRN IW 72/4.19 OZ HOT OFF THE GRILL INTEGRATED FOOD SERVICE $66.08 2555 168,834.40$      
703003 SANDWICH CHEESE GRLD WHL GR RF 72/4.24 OZ HOT OFF THE GRILL INTEGRATED FOOD SERVICE $66.96 4 267.84$              
5150006960 SANDWICH PEANUT BTR&GRAPE WHET 72/2.6 OZ JM SMUCKER JM SMUCKER COMPANY $40.13 1990 79,858.70$        
5150006961 SANDWICH PEANUT BTR&STW WHEAT 72/2.6 OZ JM SMUCKER JM SMUCKER COMPANY $41.94 1350 56,619.00$        
55293 SANDWICH STFD PPRNI IW 48/4.46 OZ BIG DADDYS PIZZA (SCHWAN) SCHWANS FOODSERVICE $40.61 1008 40,934.88$        
19582397095 SAUCE BBQ CUPS 100/1 OZ BULL'S EYE KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY $13.33 1150 15,329.50$        
10013000714409 SAUCE HONEY MUST CUP 100/1 OZ HEINZ KRAFT HEINZ FOODS COMPANY 555383,DRESSING HNY MSTRD CUP 100-1FLZ HNZ,Kraft Heinz   $18.57 760 14,113.20$        
1.00003 SAUCE HOT TEXAS PETE 200/7 GM TEXAS PETE TW GARNER FOOD CO $10.15 1266 12,849.90$        
5989538 SAUCE MARINARA ALLPURPOSE 6/10# ARREZZIO IMPERIAL NORTH WEST PACKING No Bid 847 -$                    
REDNA2ZC168 SAUCE MARINARA DIPPING CUPS 168/2.5 OZ RED GOLD RED GOLD $57.23 1028 58,832.44$        
ARRNA99 SAUCE MARINARA PREMIUM MW 6/10# ARREZZIO CLASSIC RED GOLD $40.82 267 10,898.94$        
SYIHA99 SAUCE TOMATO MIDWEST 6/10# SYSCO IMPERIAL RED GOLD 306347,SAUCE TOMATO 6-10 GCHC,Red Gold LLC,GFSHA99 $33.47 240 8,032.80$          
RC81401 SAUSAGE CHICKEN PTY FC PRM 4/5 LB RICH CHICKS RICH CHICKS LLC $128.27 700 89,789.00$        
45977000 SNACK BAR CHOC CHIP OATMEAL 144/1.24 OZ BETTY CROCKER GENERAL MILLS $52.75 79 4,167.25$          
110978000 SNACK BAR CINN TOAST CRNCH 72/2.36 OZ PILLSBURY BAKERIES GENERAL MILLS $36.68 1265 46,400.20$        
3800051109 SNACK BAR RICE KRISPIES MINI 1/600 CT KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $100.50 40 4,020.00$          
3800011052 SNACK BAR RICE KRISPIES WG 80/1.41 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $42.20 113 4,768.60$          
62933 SNACK CHEESE CRUNCHY BKD WHLGR 104/.875 OZ CHEETOS FRITO LAY $32.35 126 4,076.10$          
62984 SNACK CHEESE FLAMIN HOT BKD WG 104/.875 OZ CHEETOS FRITO LAY $32.35 176 5,693.60$          
3800024518 SNACK CINNAMON BUN 100/1.76 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $45.00 44 1,980.00$          
3010012695 SNACK CRACKER CHAT SNAX 210/1 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $42.69 384 16,392.96$        
11566000 SNACK FRUIT ROLLUP HOT COLOR 96/.5 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $27.84 107 2,978.88$          
29162000 SNACK FRUIT ROLLUP STRW LO SUG 96/.5 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $27.84 13 361.92$              
16000-11510 SNACK FRUIT SCOOBY-DOO SHAPE 96/0.9 OZ GENERAL MILLS GENERAL MILLS $25.43 225 5,721.75$          
CP5533 SPAGHETTI SAUCE W/ BEEF 4/8 LB JTM JTM PROVISIONS COMPANY INC $42.50 100 4,250.00$          
16200 STRAWBERRY BITES 185/1.1 OZ E * S FOODS E * S FOODS $35.15 300 10,545.00$        
5192BC STROMBOLI ITALIAN 72/4.2 OZ S&F FOODS S&F FOODS INC $60.50 5 302.50$              
72441 SYRUP PANCAKE & WAFFLE CUP 200/1.5 OZ HOUSE RECIPE CLASSIC DIAMOND CRYSTAL BRANDS INC $21.69 1600 34,704.00$        



05612 TOAST FRENCH HT&SRV 7/16 144/1.5 OZ SYSCO CLASSIC CONAGRA FRZ & REFRIGERATED 345286,FRENCH TOAST PRECKD 144-1.5Z ECHLK,Echo Lake Fa  $31.63 134 4,238.42$          
37720 TOAST FRENCH STK WHL GRAIN 12/2LB FARM RICH RICH FOODS $48.64 400 19,456.00$        
209903 TURKEY BREAST SLI O/RSTD .5 FZ 12/1 LB JENNIE-O JENNIE O FOODS $40.44 190 7,683.60$          
256821 TURKEY HAM SLI UNCURED FRZ 6/2 LB JENNIE-O JENNIE O FOODS $48.36 665 32,159.40$        
285628 TURKEY MEAT TACO#285628 4/7 LB JENNIE-O JENNIE O FOODS $84.00 3 252.00$              
000001474964 VEGETABLE BLEND CALIF GR A 12/2 LB SYSCO CLASSIC CN FROZEN FOODS LLC 610891,VEG BLEND CALIF 6-4# GCHC,Limson Trading (Batavia, $42.59 939 39,992.01$        
74865-01802 VEGETABLE BLEND ITALIAN GR A 12/2 LB SYSCO CLASSIC BONDUELLE CANADA 285670,VEG BLND ITAL 30# GCHC,Lakeside Foods - Frz,37005 $47.37 118 5,589.66$          
1475003 VEGETABLE BLEND JAPNSE GR A 12/2 LB SYSCO CLASSIC CN FROZEN FOODS LLC 265004,VEG BLND ORIENTAL GRD A 12-2# GCHC,Nortera Food    $54.77 4 219.08$              
2880028995 VEGETABLE BLEND WINTER GR A 12/2 LB SYSCO CLASSIC CN FROZEN FOODS LLC 285770,VEG BLND WINTER 30# GCHC,Limson Trading (Batavia  $50.30 180 9,054.00$          
3800014689 WAFFLE HMSTY WHL GRAIN 4 12/12 CT EGGO WAFFLES KELLOGG No Bid 751 -$                    
18000-32265 WAFFLE MAPLE MADNESS MINI 72/2.47 OZ PILLSBURY BAKERIES GENERAL MILLS $29.10 4 116.40$              
1584 WAFFLE MINI WG MAPLE BULK 280/0.70 OZ BAKE CRAFTERS BAKE CRAFTERS FOOD COMPANY $39.12 520 20,342.40$        
3800024698 WAFFLE WHL GRAIN EGGOJI 144/1.23 OZ KELLOGG'S KELLOGG $23.29 1455 33,886.95$        
16300 WHEAT CRACKERS 300/1 OZ E * S FOODS E * S FOODS $60.20 180 10,836.00$        
97861 WRAP TORTILLA EGG CHS BRKFST 72/2.5 OZ LOS CABOS M C I FOODS INC $49.74 1669 83,016.06$        

7,723,324.94$  
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