THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

FERTILIZER

INSECTICIDES AND PESTICIDES

ITB NO. B197357DG

OPENING DATE: April 24, 2019 2:00PM / REVISED April 7, 2022/ REVISED May 31, 2023

Diamond R Fertilizer Company, Inc.
Aftn: Thom Chester/Lisa Robinson
4100 Glades Cutoff Road
Fort Pierce, FL 34981

Howard Fertilizer & Chemical

Orlando, FL 32809

Residex, LLC
Attn: Tony P. Gerhart
12621 Corporate Lakes Drive, #2
Fort Myers, FL 33913
HDQRTS: Michigan (0%)

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Attn: Bids Department
1385 East 36th Street

Cleveland, OH 44114 (5%)

ES OPC USA LLC dba Veseris
Aftn: Debbie Kuntz/Kris Hamby
11400 Metro Parkway
Fort Myers, FL 33966

Winfield United
Attn: Doug Raynor
800 East Main Street
Immokalee, FL 34142

Phone: (772) 201-0099

Phone: (407) 855-1841

Phone: (239) 790-4988

Phone: (216) 706-9250

Phone: (239) 693-1919

Phone: (239) 707-9261

Email: Tony.Gerhart@Target- Email:
Email net  |Email om i o Email: bids@SiteOne.com  |Email: Kris.Hamby@univar.com JAMES RAYNOR@HERITAGEP)
Specialty.com
PG.COM
Email: lisa.robinson@diamond-r.com |Email Email: Email: Email Email:

ITEM

o, DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE DID NOT RENEW UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE DID NOT RENEW UNIT PRICE
15-5-15 MAGIC CARPET FERTILIZER
1 |oR APPROVED EQUAL 50LB. BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Specify product name & number
16-4-8 MAGIC CARPET FERTILIZER
2 |OR APPROVED EQUAL 50LB. BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Specify product name & number
21.0-0 AMMONIUM SULFATE FERTILIZER, GRANULAR,
3 AGRIUM OR APPROVED EQUAL 50 LB. BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Specify product name & number
4 oy CIPE: WHITHIRE 200Z. CAN NO BID $18.80 NO BID $20.50
5 ooy e AR ANT BAT 21LB. CONTAINER NO BID $43.03 NO BID sa751*
6 ST;VAA;‘PCREO?";L BEgLAGLEL 30 GRAM CARTRIDGE ; NO BID NO BID NO BID ; discontinued see advion
T Aoy eoneH GEL BAIT RESERVOIR 30 GRAM CARTRIDGE NO BID NO BID NO BID discontinued see advion
B[ o ANT BAT STATIONS - Formula 1 EACH STATION m NO BID $1.10 NO BID m $1.53
9 o rroves AN 30 EACH PER BAG Z NO BID $24.50 NO BID Z $35.81
10 QT;VA‘;:RA;‘JEGDEELQW 30 GRAM CARTRIDGE I I I NO BID $6.36 NO BID I I I $6.87
T rRovED AT BAIT 2LB. CONTAINER N $36.86 $33.49 NO BID W 538.10"
2 [ o AT 30 GRAM CARTRIDGE NO BID $5.79 NO BID $6.68
13 [ Vet cause TONS 60 EACH PER BAG P NO BID $33.91 NO BID P $48.78
14 AOD;IAOP":IsgC:: EGQE:;;NT 4 EACH 30 GRAM TUBES O NO BID $23.16 NO BID O $26.73
15 gﬁ%l:,i'o"f::g:ﬁzm” REGULATOR 16 0Z. BOTTLE Z NO BID $51.10 NO BID Z $62.23
16 gicAEPNFDRzlcEEDAggUB:‘LT 2LB. CONTAINER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
o oD paa - BAT: FORMULAS - WHITHIRE 30 GRAM TUBE ' ‘ NO BID NO BID $27.43 ' . $31.73
18 Q;E:;P';';‘\";o;ﬂvﬁf COCKROACH BAIT - WHITMIRE 30 GRAM TUBE — NO BID NO BID $27.43 — NO BID
19 e O R ICIDE, WASF OR APPROVED EQUAL 1 GALLON CONTAINER D $66.60 $68.50 NO BID D $65.48
20 | ey EauR. 80z BOTTLE $123.58 $92.68 $121.72 $101.69
21 A T 1OIPE 2-10LB. CONTAINERS NO BID (5335;313555 ) NO BID 30,08
2 [ s CaUAL 100Z. BOTTLE $108.15 $108.25 $108.15 $108.15
R vl it 2-1/2 GALLON JUG NO BID NO BID $79.00 discontinued
2 N cauA THER, BELL LABS 41B. CONTAINER ; NO BID $20.10 NO BID ; $25.87
25 | o 2-1/2 GALLON JUG I I I NO BID NO BID NO BID I I I $109.43
2 [ Ve e DCOE 2.1/2 GALLON JUG NO BID $34.05 NO BID $100.43
27 g;-:;’c;;ovsn EQUAL 17.50Z. CAN Z NO BID $11.50 NO BID Z $13.20
28 |O v pav 80z BOTTLE m NO BID $36.69 NO BID m $42.48
29 DIMENSION HERBICIDE 2.5 GALLON N $566.45 $538.75 NO BID N $570.45
O oueD EQUAL 18LB. PALL NO BID $42.76 NO BID $58.62
31 gg":réig\f;:ﬂmc'“ INSECTICIDE 1GALLON CONTAINER I NO BID 1wmr:\‘gaéng§le:£?|ueu) NO BID I $81.90
R el 1LB. CONTAINER O NO BID $37.76 NO BID O $47.89
s fpmmemcne Z oo Z
e EaUAL 4/1 GALLON CONTAINERS NO BID NO BID NO BID $244.00
35 E‘QOI\E:EHOACEIDFERQES:LSCENT 5LB. CONTAINER ' | NO BID NO BID NO BID ‘ . NO BID
36 |DETNGUISH PLUS FIRE ANT BAT 2518840 —_— s2imae 1238 NoBD ey sot0r
37 ;?;PRFA:OTIOEEEENQTSRE BAIT BLOCKS PERLB. D NO BID $12.17 NO BID D $14.87
EE Wt sad oo 25LB. CONTAINER NO BID NO BID NO BID discontinued
B[ e o, \SECT SPRAY, NISUS 1702, CAN NO BID $6.95 NO BID $9.51
40 :gf&i'}wmg’: INSECTICIDE 275 0Z. CONTAINER NOBID (wn::wug‘ :ﬁj’:ﬂ’:’:‘e 4 $69.00 discontinued
41 |GARLON 4 ULTRA HERBICIDE 25 GALLON $227.50 $235.50 $187.96 $210.10




GENTROL POINT SOURCE INSECT GROWTH REGULATOR

PR epletpei i) PER UNIT NO BID $1.20 NO BID $33.00
a3 e T INNovATIVE 1.10z. TUBE NO BID $4.53 NO BID $5.04
44 |GRASS SEED: PENSCOLABAHIA 25188 NO BID NO BID $240.75 NO BID
45 GRASS SEED: BERMUDA 251BS. NO BID NO BID $134.75 not available due to shortage
6 [ ey FERTILZER 2.5 GALLON CONTAINER NOBID $34.35 $24.69 $30.24
47 |GRAVITY LAMP CONCENTRATE 25 GALLON NOBID NOBID NO BID $105.83
48 |GRAVITY SLPGS 1QUART NOBID NO BID NO BID $70.00
[ER il 2.5 GALLON CONTAINER NO BID $83.75 $51.30 $102.18
[ oD cun 4/1 GALLON CONTAINERS $2248.00 (8562.00/gal) $395.00 NO BID $2,248.00
B[ o T CLEANSER 90Z. CAN ; $8.37 $6.43 NO BID ; $8.25
2 [ororroven vauar T 1LB. CONTAINER I I I NO BID $7.47 NO BID I I I NO BID
53 [IN-TICE FINE GRANULAR BAIT 10LB. CONTAINER Z NO BID $17.04 NO BID Z $23.14
st [o e v o T 40z NOBID $4.37 NO BID $6.01
55 g‘:f;P(;gl\}gnR:ng:LBNT GEL 4 X 35G TUBES m NO BID $20.50 NO BID m discontinued
5 [onarnoved coun 24 PER BAG m NO BID $21.50 NO BID m $29.63
BT e SANULAR ANT BATT PER LB 1 NO BID NO BID $10.46 1 NO BID
ER vttt PER UNIT I NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
59 g:xAFP?’RRCOiSSAEgL‘:T ANT BAIT 120 GRAM O NO BID $24.78 NO BID O $32.07
L vt PER UNIT Z NO BID 5051 NO BID 2 $0.70
1 e CH BAT GEL 30 GRAM TUBE NO BID $6.27 $5.77 $8.30
B2 [ e EaUALORPYRIFOS 50LB. BAG D NO BID (w_::zfln ) NO BID D NO BID
B[ AL 41B. CONTAINER D NO BID (wr:‘""g’ :fw?’:j:r‘"el‘:w " NO BID D $28.96
B | e\ EARTH CARE EACH NO BID $7.9 $9.67 NO BID
65 g:?&%‘;‘;:‘:gﬁwlnE 16 OZ. CONTAINER NO BID $40.70 NO BID $54.90
8 | Or aomRovEd 30 GRAM CARTRIDGE NO BID $5.08 NO BID $7.13
A Fedsctrasor e 12 0Z. CONTANER NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.73
68 [ oves ca T TMIRE 180Z. CAN NO BID s21.21 NO BID NO BID
I vt 90Z. CAN ; NO BID NO BID $7.02 ; NO BID
0o VED A SECTICIPE 2102, BOTTLE I I I NO BID $67.65 NO BID I I I 7515%
PRECOR 2000 PLUS
7 g:;:;:':z:i‘;i‘:‘r’“‘:"& umber 16 0Z. CAN Z NO BID $12.18 NO BID Z $15.25
|Sample required if other than specified
72 ZLQ‘;::E:;; :g'J AL 20 0Z. CAN I I I NO BID $19.53 NO BID I I I 2575
73 [P PHANTOM Il PRESSURIZED INSECTICIDE - OR APPROVED 17502, CAN m NOBD BB NOBD m $19.49
T 8702 BOTTLE $632.00 $588.50 $632.00 69200 agency priced by
5| eROVeD A 3202, BOTTLE P 533801 NOBID NO BID P 279.48%
76 ggAACPI:’I:g\Elgg’;g:::LTWV VICTOR M330 PER UNIT O NO BID $1.02 NO BID O (43_;;"; )
77 [SENCOR 5 GALLON JUG Z NO BID $399.42 NO BID Z $520.00
78 g;ii::ol-VREgAECQ“Ui:‘T 30 GRAM CARTRIDGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 |STICKER GULF STREAM 2.5 GALLON JUG ‘ ‘ NOBID NOBID 35813 ‘ ‘ $102.18
(523.25 for 1 gal)
B0 [ e e HERBICIDE 2.5 GALLON CONTAINER — NO BID $57.20 NO BID — $68.25
LI e 1LB. CONTAINER D NO BID NO BID NO BID D discontinued
82 Z:RAEPGP:AOR;’DE:EERQ?;EDE 5LB. CONTAINER NO BID $545.50 NO BID discontinued liquid only now
B[ oveD EQUAL 160Z. BOTTLE NO BID $36.00 NO BID $43.20
L7 e 2.5 GALLON CONTAINER $157.53 $128.67 $112.07 $141.32
B | o ueD EQUAL 2518.BAG $34.38 $24.48 $24.02 $36.20
B [ e e SECTICIDE 16 0Z. CONTAINER NO BID $20.46 NO BID $42.68
g7 [TEMPO 20 W.P. INSEGTICIDE 420 GRAM JAR NO BID $69.60 NO BID $85.60

OR APPROVED EQUAL




TEMPO SC ULTRA

$42.05
8 |0R APPROVED EQUAL 802.BOTTLE NOBID (842,63 for 240 ML) NOBID $54.19
' TERMIDOR SC TERMITICIDE/INSECTICIDE
89 | On APPROVED EQUAL 20 0Z. BOTTLE NO BID $66.36 NO BID $78.08
TERMIDOR SC TERMITICIDE/INSECTICIDE 166.14 this is agency price
%0 'OR APPROVED EQUAL 7802, BOTTLE NOBID SR NOBID manufacturer set price
' TERRO-PCO - NISUS
91 (OR APPROVED EQUAL PER STATION NO BID $0.67 NO BID NO BID
TERRO-PCO LIQUID ANT BAIT- NISUS I I I $5.46 I I I
92| 0R APPROVED EQUAL 160z NOBID $5.93 (843,65 for 1 gal) NOBID
'TOP CHOICE FIRE ANT GRANULES X
93 |OR APPROVED EQUAL 50 LB. BAG Z $106.50 (857.00 for 30 Ib bag) NO BID Z $100.00
TRAPPER GLUE BOARDS
94| OR APPROVED EQUAL PER UNIT NOBID NOBID $0.83 33112pk
' TRAPPER T-REX MOUSE TRAP m m
95 NO SUBSTITUTION EACH NO BID $1.07 NO BID $5.36
TRAPPER T-REX RODENT TRAP
9% NO SUBSTITUTION EACH m NOBID a0 NOBID m 8536
TRIBUTE TOTAL HERBICIDE
97 (OR APPROVED EQUAL 60Z. BOTTLE I $382.00 $385.00 $382.00 I $382.00
98  [TRIPLE CROWN 1GALLON JUG $307.00 $292.25 $292.25 $292.25
99 VASTLAN HERBICIDE 2.5 GALLON JUG O NO BID NO BID $187.96 O $230.00
VENDETTA PLUS ROACH GEL BAIT, BASF - NO Z Z
100 |SBSTITUTION 4X30G TUBES NOBID $21.98 NO BID $31.06
VICTOR SNAP TRAPS, MOUSE
101 (OR APPROVED EQUAL PER UNIT NO BID $1.07 NO BID $0.54
WASP FREEZE - WHITMIRE ' . ' .
102 | oo APPROVED EQUAL 17.50Z. CAN NO BID $7.95 NO BID $8.74
103 |XONERATE HERBICIDE 90z TUB D $493.50 $479.00 $479.00 D 479.00/ 12 0z bottle
104 [CATALOG DISCOUNT OFF BALANCE OF LINE % DISCOUNT NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
1 UNDERSTAND AND HAVE THE ABILITY TO ACCEPT CREDIT CARDS FOR PAYMENT AS SPECIFIED v ve v v ve v
ON PAGE 14 - SECTION 10. (YES OR NO) es es es es es es
Required Submittal Checklist Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment A - Bid Response Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
D - Addenda Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
H ini Company Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
1- Related Agreement Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment J - Waiver of Trade Secrets Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment K - Statement of Principal Place of Business Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment L - Guarantee/Warranty Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
(1) Original and (1) copy of ITB Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Electronic copy of the ITB Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

32 Vendor(s) Were Notified of ITB
6 Vendor(s) Submitted a Bid
0 Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid

26 Vendor(s) Did Not Respond

"] -prmARY VENDOR : = SECONDARY VENDOR

* = In-State Preference

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS ITB BE AWARDED TO DIAMOND R FERTILIZER COMPANY, INC., HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL COMPANY, INC., RESIDEX, LLC, SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, UNIVAR SOLUTIONS AND WINFIELD UNITED VENDORS HAVING SUBMITTED THE LOWEST OVERALL AND BEST

RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

APPROVED BY: [&
!

ITB TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

DATE:

ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. ITB NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).




	Renewal 2

