THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Bongards Creameries, Inc.
Attn: Jill Ponder, Director of K12 Sales
250 Lake Drive E.
Chanhassen, MN 55317

ES Foods
Attn: Olivia Kan
20 Crossways Park N, Suite 100
Woodbury, NY 11797

JTM Provisions Co., Inc.
Attn: Brian Hofmeier
200 Sales Drive
Harrison, OH 45030

Land O'Lakes, Inc.
Attn: Alethia Scheett
4001 Lexington Ave. N. MS 3015
Arden Hills, MN 55126

ITB NO. B237453JA

USDA COMMODITY PROCESSESED CHEESE

OPENING DATE: May 23, 2023 AT 2:00 PM

Phone: 952-277-5582

Phone: 516-682-5494

Phone: 800-626-2308

Phone: 651-375-2364

Email: Jill.Ponder@Bongards.com

Email: bids@esfoods.com

Email: brianhofmeier@jtmfoodgroup.com

Email: K12Specialist@landolakes.com

ITEM APPROXIMATE ANNUAL PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
NO. PRODUCT DESCRIPTION uom QUANTITIES PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER CASE PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER CASE PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER CASE PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER CASE
160 Slice 50% Reduced Sodium, f:f;\deﬁl:JillJt:-:; f;er:l5::tgim::;zzf:;:\:;;sf/\ 111331 46288
° L 8 P . . 160 Slice 50% Reduced Sodium, 50% $73.16 . . 160-slice 50% Reduced Sodium, 50% $25.67
1. | 50% Reduced Fat Yellow American [meat/meat alternate per loz. serving. Made with cs 1000 . No Bid No Bid 3
N " Reduced Fat Yellow American Cheese: 960 $.08/svg Reduced Fat Process American Cheese $.03/svg
Cheese Skim Milk. Must Supply <4g fat, <2.5g saturated fat, slices/case, .SM/MA per slice, 6/5# (vellow)
0g Trans Fat, <210mg sodium. Made in USA. ' P !
8 - 1.5LB., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1 114431
meat/meat alternate per 1oz. serving (2 slices). Made 160 Slice Natural Pasteurized Blended Swiss | $54.52 44261 $23.88
2. Reduced Fat Swiss Ch Sliced |y i cs 200 N No Bid No Bid y
educed Fat swiss Lheese, Sliced lwith Reduced Fat Milk. Must Supply <6g fat, <3.5g Cheese: 640 slices/case, .5SM/MA per slice, [ $.09/svg o B o B Reduced Fat Swiss Readi-Pac Cheese Slices $.06/svg
saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <115mg sodium. Made in a5
USA.
8 - 1.5LB., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1
meat/meat alternate per 1oz. serving (2 slices). Made ‘ Lk
3. Pepper Jack Cheese, Sliced with Cultured Pasteurized Milk and Red and Green cs 200 160 Slice Natural Past‘eurlzed Blended Peppe $54.30 No Bid No Bid 44.238 4 $18.76
Jalapeno Peppers. Must Supply <9g fat, <6g saturated Jack Cheese: 540‘5|ICES/CHSE, .5M/MA per $.09/svg Pepper Jack Readi-Pac Cheese Slices $.05/svg
fat, Og Trans Fat, <210mg sodium. Made in USA. slice, 4/5#
8 - 1.5LB., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1 114421
. . 44224
Reduced Fat Cheddar Cheese, |Meat/meat alternate per 1oz serving (2 slices). Made 160 Slice Natural Pasteurized Blended $51.98 ' ' ' ) $18.76
4. Sliced with Reduced Fat Milk. Must Supply <7g fat, <4.5g cs 350 Reduced Fat Cheddar Cheese: 640 $.08/svg No Bid No Bid Reduced Fat Mild ChFddar Readi-Pac Cheese $.05/svg
saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <190mg sodium. Made in slices/case, .5M/MA per slice, 4/5# Slices
USA.
6 - 5LB., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1 755711
meat/meat alternate per 1oz. serving. Made with Reduced Fat Yellow Cheddar Cheese $57.40 41749 $13.07
: . : ; - No Bid No Bid ) -
5 Cheddar Cheese, Shredded | Cultured Pasteurized Milk. Must Supply<9g fat, <6g & 1250 Shredded 755711: 320 1oz svngs/case, $.18/svg o8 o8 Shredded Mild Cheddar Cheese $.04/svg
saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <190mg sodium. Made in IM/MA per oz, 4/5#
USA.
6 - 5LB., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1 B —
6. | Mozzarella Cheese Low- Moisture meat/meat alternate per loz. serving. Made with o 50 Mozzarella Cheese Low- Moisture Part-skim, | $81.98 No Bid No Bid 41698 $12.30
. Part-Skim, Shredded Cultured Part-Skim Milk. Must Supply <6g fat, <3.5¢ Shredded: 480 1oz svngs/case, IM/MA per | $.17/svg Shredded Mozzarella Cheese $.04/svg
saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <210mg sodium. Made in . G
USA. !
Mild Cheddar Cheese Cracker Cuts, BULK,
Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA Child Nutrition
Mild Cheddar Cheese Cracker Cuts |Program specifications and meet 1 meat/meat . . . 44006 $35.51
. No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 alternative per 1 oz. serving. Must supply <9g fat, o 1250 o8l o8l o8l Mild Cheddar Cheese Cracker Cuts $.15/svg
<6g saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <200mg sodium.
Made in USA.
168 - 1oz., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1 402991
Light Mozzarella Cheese, String, |Meat/meat alternate per 1oz. serving. Made with Part Light Mozzarella Cheese, String, Individually | $36.05 ' ' 59703 $13.85
8. vi jons_|Skim Milk. Must Supply <3g fat, <2 saturated fat, O & 5000 i No id No id i i
Individually Wrapped Portions . pply <3g fat, <2g ,0g Wrapped Portions: 168ct/10z, IM/MA per |  $.21/svg Light Mozzarella String Cheese $.08/svg
Trans Fat, <200mg sodium. Made in USA. stick, 10.5#
200 - 1oz., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1
Reduced Fat Cheddar Cheese | meat/meat alternate per oz. serving. Made with ) ) _ 44113 $33.99
9. | Cubes, Individually Wrapped  |peduced Fat Milk. Must Supply<7g fat, <4.5¢ cs 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Reduced Fat Mild Cheddar Cheese Cubes | S-17/5VE
Portions saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <190mg sodium. Made in
USA.
200 - 1oz., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1 .
i i 33.99
- meat/meat alternate per loz. serving. Made with
10. Reduced Fat Co-Jack Cheese Cubes,| cs 4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 44115 $17/sv8

Individually Wrapped Portions

Reduced Fat Milk. Must Supply <7g fat, <4g saturated
fat, Og Trans Fat, £180mg sodium. Made in USA.

Reduced Fat Colby Jack Cheese Cubes




11.

Reduced Fat Cheddar Cheese
Cubes

4 - 5lb., BULK, Refrigerated. Must conform to USDA
Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet 1
meat/meat alternate per 1oz. serving. Made with
Reduced Fat Milk. Must Supply <7g fat, <4.5g
saturated fat, Og Trans Fat,

<190mg sodium. Made in USA.

cs

200

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

44751
Reduced Fat Mild Cheddar Cheese Cubes,
Bulk

$27.89
$.09/scg

12.

Ultimate Yellow Cheese Sauce

6 - 1060z., BULK, Dry. Shelf Stable. Must conform to
USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet
1 meat/meat alternate per 3oz. serving. Must Supply
<9g fat, <6g saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <400mg
sodium. Made in USA.

cs

2500

No Bid

No Bid

JTM - 5705

$48.82
$.19/svg

39945
Ultimate Yellow Cheese Sauce

$40.07
$.19/svg

13.

Ultimate Jalapeno Cheese Sauce

6 - 10602., BULK, Dry. Shelf Stable. Must conform to
USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet
1 meat/meat alternate per 3oz. serving. Must Supply
<9g fat, <6g saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <400mg
sodium. Made in USA.

Cs

1500

No Bid

No Bid

JTM - 5731

$50.32
$.22/svg

39946
Ultimate Jalapeno Cheese Sauce

$40.07
$.19/svg

14.

Ultimate Creamy White Cheese
Sauce

6 - 1060z., BULK, Dry. Shelf Stable. Must conform to
USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet
1 meat/meat alternate per 3oz. serving. Must Supply
<10g fat, <6g saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <400mg
sodium.

Made in USA.

cs

750

No Bid

No Bid

JT™M - 5730

$49.63
$.19/svg

39947
Ultimate Creamy White Cheese Sauce

$46.95
$.22/svg

15.

Ultimate Cheddar Cheese Sauce,
30z Cup Portion

140 - 30z., BULK, Dry. Shelf Stable. Must conform to
USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet
1 meat/meat alternate per 3oz. serving. Must Supply
<10g fat, <6g saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <570mg
sodium.

Made in USA.

[

300

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

39911
Ultimate Cheddar Cheese Dip Cups

$60.75
$.43/svg

16.

Mucho Queso Jalapeno Cheese
Sauce, 30z Cup Portion

140 - 30z., BULK, Dry. Shelf Stable. Must conform to
USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and meet
1 meat/meat alternate per 3oz. serving. Must Supply
<10g fat, <6g saturated fat, Og Trans Fat, <560mg
sodium.

Made in USA.

[

300

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

39912
Mucho Queso Jalapeno Cheese Dip Cups

$60.75
$.43/svg

17.

Reduced Sodium, Reduced Fat
Macaroni & Cheese w/ Whole
Grain

6 - 5LB., BULK, Frozen. Must conform to USDA Child
Nutrition Program specifications and meet 2
meat/meat, 1 grain per 60z. serving. Made with Skim
Milk. Must Supply <11g fat, <5g saturated fat, Og
Trans Fat, <670mg sodium. Made in USA.

cs

7500

No Bid

05915
‘WG Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium Macaroni
& Cheese Pouch, 6/5 Ibs.
(80/6 oz serving per case)

$42.52
$.53/svg

JTM - 5768

$44.00
$.55/svg

43274
Reduced Sodium, Reduced Fat Macaroni &
Cheese Entrée with Whole Grain

$46.29
$.58/svg

It is recommended that this ITB be awarded to_ES Foods, and

60 VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED

4 VENDORS SUBMITTED A BID

0 VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO - BID
56 VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND

\ s Ayt N/
oun WOShal:lA:

APPROVED BY: Joni Al-Shabibi

DATE:

June 6, 2023

PRIMARY VENDOR
SECONDARY VENDOR

Land O'Lakes, Inc., as primary vendors and Bongards Creameries, Inc., and JTM Provisions Co., Inc., as secondary vendors, having submitted the lowest overall and best response meeting specifications.




