‘The School District of Lee County

Department of Procurement Services.

2855 Colonial Bivd.
Fort Myers, Florida 33966

Award - December 8, 2020 through December 7, 2021
Renewed through December 7, 2024

All American Poly
Attn: Zeke Rosenwasser/Nikki

Klein

40 Turner Place
Piscataway, NJ 08854

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Calico Packaging, LLC
Attn: Christopher Hartnett/Jon Jaret
10621 Iron Bridge Road, Suite F
Jessup, MD 20794

Central Poly-Bag Corporation
Attn: Andrew Hoffer/Nicole
Lawson
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036

Fastenal Company
Attn: Terry Owen/Christopher

Fornes

2001 Theurer Boulevard
Winona, MN 55987

Imperial Bag & Paper
Company, LLC
Attn: Vickie Scaglione/Lisa

Barash

5101 E Hanna Avenue
Tampa, FL 33610

Interboro Packaging Corporation
Attn: Miriam Berger/Abraham
Jeremias
114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 813-621-6446

Unipak Corporation
Attn: Brian Marcus
PO Box 300027
Brooklyn, NY 11230

Trash Can Liners for District Warehouse (DWO) Phone: (732) 752-3200 Phone: (866) 835-6060 Phone: (800) 638-0828 Phone: (908) 562-7570 Phone: (507) 454-5374 Phone: (813) 621-3091 Phone: (845) 782-6800 Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (888) 808-5120
ITB NO. B207383JC
THURSDAY, Ontober 19, 2030 @ 2:00 PAM Email: zske@atomealycom Email: Email: Email: Biss@eentapol.com Email: oGl Email: Email: Ema: Emall: | ot
Revised: June 28, 2023
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District W: Delivery T
Liner, Disposable for Sanitary
Napkin Receptacle, 6 mic, Clear IN.I;\';”&L'
plastic,17" x 18", 40 rolls, 50 CALICO pelr
CW-77781 bags per, 2000 per H1716061 | 2000 $16.07| gono0q7 RO0O/CS $19.44 Sk 2000 | $11.68/CS NO BID NO BID
Case,SAMPLE REQUIRED 77781 M-Ir‘
Estimated Al | Quantity: 100 s
stimated Annual Quantity: 1BS/Capital
Liner, Disposable for Sanitary HOSPE
Napkin Receptacle, Waxed, 9" X co
10" X 3 1/4", Gusseted, 250 case, #HS614
Hospeco HS-6141, OR 1
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE **MINIM
CW-77782 REQUIRED NO BID NO BID NO BID UM 250/CS | $17.58 NO BID
Estimated Annual Quantity: 100 ORDER
1S 50
CASES*
Liner, Garbage Can, Plastic, INT-231040-|
PolyPlastic, 1.5 Mil Minimum, 23" Exh, As per
x 10" x 40",Gusseted, Must Fit sample
Huskee 44Gallon Can, With/ CALICO #3/CW-
CW-78830 Twist Ties, Black, 250 per Case, L3340250R| 250 $29.53| o0 [250/Cs $30.64 78830, M| 250 | $38.6841Cs NO BID UPcaox| 250 | $35.00
SAMPLE REQUIRED 1BS/
Estimated Annual Quantity: 1500 Capital/Glop
ak
Liner, Compactor Use, 2 Mil INT-3340-
ealed, 33" x 40" Black, 250 per As
Case, SAMPLE REQUIRED, CALICO s:mpj;
CW-78833 Estimated Annual Quantity: 6000 1334022501 250 $38.95 9911025 [250/CS $44.24 #4/CW- 250 | $47.36/Cs NO BID 3330XH| 250 | $46.00
R 78833. Mfr:
1BS/
Capital/Glop
ak
Liner, Recycling Can, INT-3340-H,
ClearPlastic, Heavy Duty, 16 D NO U U U As per
Micron Minimum,23” x 10" x 39", ~ LONGER]| CALICO - e e sample UPC391
CW-78835 250 per Case, SAMPLE U H334016N | 250 PROVIDE| 9970130 250/CS] $19.94| U D U #5/CW- 250 $20.83/Cs NO BID 6 250 $18.60
REQUIRED S| 78835. Mfr:
z z z z
PIastic,Med\ij—Heavy Duty, 24" O O o o As per '
CW-78841 X 2471000 per Case, 10 Gallon — H42406N | 1000 §9.32| CALICO /50,04 $14.64 — — — sample 1000 | $16.22/Cs NO BID upc246| 1000 | $11.75
Size,20 rolls/50 bags per roll, 9970001 #6/CW-
black or clear, 6-8 Micron, x x x x 78840. Mfr:
SAMPLE REQUIRED m m m m 1BS/Capital
Liner, Waste, 13 — 15 Gallons,24” (0)] (0)] (0)] (0)] INT-2433-H
x 33", 8 Micron, Medium-Heavy v v ) ) As per !
Duty,black or clear, 20 rolls/50
CW-78842 bags per roll ,SAMPLE o H243308N | 1000 [ 525 85) SAICO Jors0ice $20.21 o e} O sampe | 1000 | s2145/Cs NO BID UPC338| 1000 | $20.70
REQUIRED Z P Z Z 78842, Mir:
Estimated Annual Quantity: 800 D D D D IBS/ Capital
Liner, Garbage Can, Plastic, = "
PolyPlastic, 1.5 Mil Minimum, 37" é’:: 3A:4:er
x 44", Must Fit Huskee 44 Gallon se;mp\e
Can, With/Twist Ties, Black, 250 CALICO #8/CW-
CW-78846 per Case,SAMPLE REQUIRED L3744150R| 250 $36.42 9911529 250/CS] $43.91 78845, Mfr: 250 $49.04/Cs NO BID PPC44C1| 250 $49.50
Estimated Annual Quantity: 1200 BS
Capital/Glop
ak
Liner, Waste, 55 Gallon,
Drum,Black, 2 mil Minimum, 38" INT-3860-
X 60", Star Seal, 50 case Flexsol Super Exh,
ECO600SXH LDPE, OR As per
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE Flexsol sample 31.96
CW-78850 REQUIRED L3860200R| 50 $15.98| ECO600S | 50/CS $20.34 #9/CW- 100 $15.98/Cs| NO BID 603PL 50 $17.20]
Estimated Annual Quantity: 600 XH 788IABQSIWK of 50
Capi op
ak

Page 1 of



mailto:zeke@allampoly.com
mailto:Mvale@allfloridapaper.com
mailto:bids@calicopackaging.com
mailto:Bids@centralpoly.com
mailto:cfornes@fastenal.com
mailto:Tampabids@Imperialdade.com
mailto:Abraham@interboropackaging.com
mailto:biddept@pyramidsp.com
mailto:zeke@allampoly.com
mailto:Mvale@allfloridapaper.com
mailto:bids@calicopackaging.com
mailto:Abraham@interboropackaging.com
mailto:biddept@pyramidsp.com
mailto:Bids@centralpoly.com
mailto:cfornes@fastenal.com
mailto:cfornes@fastenal.com
mailto:Tampabids@Imperialdade.com

10.| CW-78851

Liner, Waste, 45 — 50
Gallons,Plastic, 43" x 48", 17
Micron, XHeavy,black, 200 per
Case,

SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 400

11.| CW-78855

Liner, Compactor Use, 1.3 Mil
Minimum, PolyPlastic, 43" X 58"
minimum, clear, 65 gallon, 100
per case SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 100

12. ARO

Arrival Time in Days

13. BOL

Percentage discount off balance of ine:

CALICO
H434717N | 200 $22.33 0930372 200/CS| $26.44
CALICO 100/C
L4350130C| 100 $28.02| 99SP435 $44.54
S
8HC
5 30 DAYS
Yes Yes

INT-4348-
XH, As per
sample
#10/CW-
78851. Mfr:
IBS/Capital

200

$27.73/Cs

NO BID

434817

200

$23.20]

INT-4358-X-
Hvy, As per
sample
#11/CW-
78855. Mfr:

100

$24.32/Cs

NO BID

UPC435
8C13

100

5 Days ARO

10-14 DAYS AR.O.

1-10

Yes, 50%

YES (10%)

No

NOTE: Central Poly-Bag Corp, Fastenal Company, Imperial Bag & Paper Co, LLC

and Office Depot did not renew.

Page 2 of




	 B207383JC Trash Can Liners

