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The Scheool Board of Volusia Couﬁty, Flcrida
200 N, Clara Avende, Del.and, FL 32720

Agenda Item Details

Meeting - Oct 13, 2020 - Agenda - 3:30 PM - The School Board of Voiusia County, Flarida
Cétegory 9. Consent-Operations Services-Purchasing

Subject 9,01 ITB TR-21-0004MB, Recapped & New Tires

Access : Public

Type Action {Consent)

Fiscal Impact Yes

Dollar Amount ' 150,753.66

Budgeted Yes

Budget Source General

Recommended Action The superintendent recommends approval of ITB TR-21-0004MB, Recapped and New Tires.

Goals Focus Area 6-Operations/Infrastructure

Public Content

BACKGROUND:

Requesting approval to award this contract to multiple vendors providing products and services for the Student Transportation
Services Department and Facilities Maintenance Department to supply Recapped & New Tires w/Related Tire Services for buses
and other fleet vehicles, in accordance with the terms, conditions, and specifications listed and described in the body of the
solicitation.

SUBMITTED BY: .
Maria Kraft, Director of Purchasing & Warehouse Services

10-13-20 BOARD - TR-21-004MB - Recapped & New Tires and Related Tire Sves.pdf (1,355 KB) l

Administrative Content

Motion &Votlng
~ The superintendent recommends approval of all items in the consent agenda.
Motion by Ruben Colon, second by Jamie Haynés

Final Resolution: Motion Carries
Yea: Ida D Wright, Linda L Cuthbert, Carl Persis, Jamie Haynes, Ruben Colon

hitps://go.boarddocs.com/flafvesfi/Board. nsfiPrivate ?open&login#
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SCHOOL DISTRICT OF VOLUSIA COUNTY
NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION

BID NUMBER: TR-21-004MB BOARD DATE: 10/13/2020
BID NAME: Recapped & New Tires and Related Tire Services
EFFECTIVE: October 14, 2020 - October 13, 2023

ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST: $150,753.66

NOTE: The Estimated Annual Cost is based on historical spend data.

VENDOR AWARD RECOMMENDATION:

Section 1 - Recap Radial Tires
Primary Vendor:
Earl W. Colvard, Inc., dba Boulevard Tire Center, DelLand, FL

Section 2 - New Radial Tires

Primary Vendor - Lines 1-3

Monro Muffler Brake, Inc., dba McGee Commercial Tire, Rochester, NY
Primary Vendor - Lines 4-9

Earl W. Colvard, Inc., dba Boulevard Tire Center, DelLand, FL

Section 3 - Miscellaneous Services

Primary Vendor:

Earl W. Colvard, Inc., dba Boulevard Tire Center, DelLand, FL
Secondary Vendor:

Monro Muffler Brake, Inc., dba McGee Commercial Tire, Rochester, NY




BID NO.: TR-21-004MB Date: October 13, 2020
Recapped & New Tires and Related Tire Services

The School District of Volusia County
Effective Date: 10/14/2020 - 10/13/2023

Earl W. Colvard, Inc., dba Boulevard [ Monro Muffler Brake, Inc., dba McGee
Tire Center, DeLand, FL Commercial Tire, Rochester, NY
Section 1: RECAP RADIAL TIRES
Item # Description Price Price
1 20,000 Mile Warranty
255/70R22.5 86.70 | * No Bid
11R22.5 100.75 | * No Bid
2 25,000 Mile Warranty
255/70R22.5 $ 103.85 | * No Bid
11R22.5 $ 11430 | * No Bid
3 30,000 Mile Warranty
255/70R22.5 $ 113.02 | * No Bid
11R22.5 $ 12392 | * No Bid
Section 2: NEW RADIAL TIRES
Item # Description Price Price
1 Goodyear G668 or Marathon RSA  [255/70R22.5 LR "H" No Bid S 236.00
2 Goodyear G668 or Marathon RSA  |11R22.5LR"G" No Bid 5 259.00
3 Goodyear G668 or Marathon RSA  |11R22.5 LR "H" No Bid 5 262.00
4 Bridgestone R250 255/70R22.5 LR "H" $ 303.00 | * No Bid
5 Bridgestone R268 11R22.5LR"G" $ 330.00 | * No Bid
6 Bridgestone R268 11R22.5 LR "H" $ 350.00 | * No Bid
7 Firestone FS561 255/70R22.5 LR "H" $ 272.74 | * No Bid
8 Firestone FS561 11R22.5LR"G" S 286.00 | * No Bid
9 Firestone FS561 11R22.5 LR "H" $ 290.00 | * No Bid

* Recommended lowest acceptable bid.
NOTE A. Section 1 - Approximately 900 recapped radial tires may be purchased; 800 each of the 11R22.5 and 100 each of the 255/70R22.5

NOTE B. Section 2 - Approximately 275 new radial tires may be purchased; 75 each of the 255/70R22.5LR and 200 each of the 11R22.5 LR




BID NO.: TR-21-004MB Date: October 13, 2020
Recapped & New Tires and Related Tire Services

The School District of Volusia County
Effective Date: 10/14/2020 - 10/13/2023

Earl W. Colvard, Inc., dba Boulevard [ Monro Muffler Brake, Inc., dba McGee
Tire Center, DelLand, FL Commercial Tire, Rochester, NY
Section 3: MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES
Item Description Price Price
A. Tire Mounting s 6.00* [$S 2250 | A
B. Tire Dismounting S 1000 [ * [ S 15.00 | A
C. Wheel Balancing s 18.00 [ * [ $ 1499 | A
D. Metal Wheel Valve S 250 * [ S 5.95 | A
E. Service Call (Flat Fee) S 103.00 | * | $ 85.00 | A
F. Service Call Mileage per Mile No Charge | * $1.00 after first 20 miles | A
G. Tire Repair (Nail puncture) S 20.78 | * [ $ 2250 | A
H. Tire Section Repair S 41.32 | * No Bid A
. Scrap Tire Disposal Fee $ 850 |* [$ 8.00 [ A
J. Powder Coat Wheel - Black S 25.00 | * [ $ 2250 | A
K. Powder Coat Wheel - School Bus Yellow $ 25.00 | * | $ 22.50 [ A
ADDITIONAL SERVICES
A. Percentage Cost-Plus Mark-Up 10% * 15% A
B. Casing Buyback 11R22.5 $ 50.00 | * |$ 25.00 | A
C. Casing Buyback 255/70R22.5 S 25.00 | * | $ 25.00 | A

* - Recommended lowest acceptable bid
A - Recommended Secondary

NOTE C. Section 3 - Miscellaneous Services are used as-needed (Line Items A. thru C. are the most commonly used)

ITB sent to: 163 vendors
Bid responses received from: 2 vendors
NO BIDS were received from: 0 vendors

Purchasing Department Approval:

Brian J. Clem

APPROXIMATE ANNUAL COST: $150,753.66

Digitally signed by Brian J. Clem
Date: 2020.09.25 13:58:10 -04'00' Date:

9/25/2020

This tabulation is posted as public notice for 72 hours from 4:00 P.M., Friday, September 25, 2020 until 4:00 P.M., Wednesday, September 30, 2020. Bidders are hereby notified that failure to protest|
within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of 2:00 P.M., September 22, 2020. All other offers submitted in

response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.




