The School District of Lee County Acuity Specialty Products, Inc. d/b/a
Department of Procurement Services Zep Sales and Service All Florida Paper S W-Nowli e Ecolab, X Office Depot, LLC Pyramid School Products
2855 Colonial Blvd. Attn: Maureena Fabien-Watson / Attn: Mario Vale / Angelica Gamboa Atta-ChristopherWayhe Nowha AttrDale Mrozinski Attn: Matt Shedlock / Tim Labrie Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
Fort Myers, Florida 33966 James Detamore 9150 NW 105th Way 336 Riverview Road 1 Ecolab Place 6600 North Military Trail 6510 North 54th Street
Award - February 8, 2022 through February 7, 2023 3330 Cumberland Boulevard, Suite 700| Miami, FL 33178 MadisonHeights, VA 245723723 StPaukMN-55102 Boca Raton, FL 33496-2434 Tampa, FL 33610-1908
Renewed through February 7, 2024 (one renewal remaining) Atlanta, GA 30339
1TB NO. B217413ES Phone: (677) 428937 Phone: (305) 755-4820 Phone: et 70028 Phone: (95218520958 |phone: (561) 4384800 Phone: (613) 6216446
CLEANING PRODUCTS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS (DWO) Fax: (404) 367-4072 Fax: (305) 884-8424. Fax: Fax: o5t 30e-5420 Fax: (800) 593-8830 Fax: (813) 621-7688
OPENING DATE: WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 1, 2021 AT 2:00 PM Mvale@allfloridapaper.com i L y
g iames.detamore@zep.com g il: cwnowlin2012@gmail.com | Email: gov.sales@ecolab.com il: g
REVISED: March 26, 2024 Email james.detamore@zep.com  |emai Aambesoaliortimmecom |FT cwnowin2012@gmailcom  |Email ovsales@ecolab.com | emait Email dept
mem | soic DESCRIPTION von | aoat | ooueT | auantmypen [ peuveren | propucr name | quantirvper | oeuveReo ool | auantirvees | peuvereo | PROPUCT | quavtiryper | peuvereo
nO. [ PART No. quanTiTy | ano nowiser | PACKAGE/CASE [ price | anDNuMBER | pAckaGe/case | pRice o nowsen | PACKAGE/case [ e | SOPR | packace/case | pice
Cleaner, Oven & Grill, For Use on Porcelain, Iron &
’ ¥ v BETCO Jell $3.99 gt
CW- [stainless Steel, Quart Containers, 12/320z case, Theochem
NOBID
B 76140 | Theochem 514 Magic Oven, OR APPROVED EQUAL, ar 200 0:?’3‘ ;5?)':' 2 $89.10/case |  #100514 12qt/case s"‘ii case
SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED
cw. |Cleaner,Stainless Steel & polish, Non Aerosol Quart
2| Jergs [Cans Sheila Shine Brand 3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL, | QT 200 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
[SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED

Liquid Chlorinated Alkaline Cleaner, Heavy Duty

CLOROX
cw-  |Kitchen and Bathroom Cleaner with Bleach, Ready to
d NO BID NO BID
3 76146 |Use, 20 oz bottles, Ecolab Lemon Lift, OR APPROVED B =00 mo::ggozs ° $4294
EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED
Alkaline Cleaner formulated for use i refrigerated or
cw. |freezer environments, Concentrated, Ready to Use, 1
4 26147 |82llon bottles, 4 gallons per case, Ecolab Kool Klene cs 50 NOBID NO BID NO BID
QD, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS
REQUIRED
cw. [Cleaner/Degreaser, All Purpose Concentrate, T-15 Theochem T-
5 6191 |Cleaner Degreaser, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE GAL 600 NO BID NO BID 14 4/1galfcase [ $57.98 case
|AND SDS REQUIRED #100478
Dishwashing Compound, Liquid in Gallon Bottle, Dawn
cw- Dawn $18.79 gal
NO BID NOBID
6 | o103 ig;uslzans, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE ANDSDS [  GAL 3000 pacsraasc | A/ 18alease | O
Descaling Compound, Liquid for Machine Dishwashers,
cw- | concentrated Lime Remover, 1 Gallon Container, Theochem $16.99 gal
. . NO BID NOBID
7| 76200 |Theochem #950, OR APPROVED EQUAL samPLE AND | CAC 100 #950 dgalease | o7 o6 case
SDS REQUIRED
Detergent, All Purpose & Laundry, Powder, Includes
CW- |Optical Brighteners and Anti Soil Agents, Tide 36 L8, Tide
NO BID NOBID
8 76205 P86 102364, BX 300 P6C02364 36HBox | $127.98 box
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED
. |Petereent, All Purpose & Laundry, Powder, Low Suds, Boardwalk
9 | yea07 |General Use, 40 LB pail, BOARDWALK HURACAN OR PAIL 700 NO BID NOBID BQHURACAN|  40ttpail $27.89 pail
|APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED 40

Dishwashing Compound, Hand Washing, Powder, 501
10 72‘;‘/1'0 80, P &G Cream Suds, OR APPROVED EQUAL, BX 100 NOBID C’L%‘T’;‘Fi‘i“’s 1 $69.14 NOBID
[SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED

[Dishwasher Compound, Machine, Chlorinated with
cw. [sodium Siicates, Alkaline Substances, Biodegradable,
11 [ ooy, |Powdered Products only, 200/1.50z Pre Measured s 50 NOBID NOBID

Packets, Theochem Sparkle, OR APPROVED EQUAL,
\MPLE AND SDS REQUIRED

NO BID NO BID

Cleaner/Floor, Dissolvable Pouches, 30 - 2.6 oz

12 72‘2’5' Pouches/Box, Micro Best, OR APPROVED EQUAL, BX 500 NO BID NO BID NOBID
SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED
cw. |Ecolab - Oasis 146 multi-Quat Sanitizer 2.5 gallon,
(ONLY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS GAL NOBID NOBID NO BID

76668 | pequireD

O >x >SS >

B . Zep Spirit Il I < Highmark
Wipe, Disinfecting, Lemon Fresh Scent, 75 wipes per . : .
16 | SN | et lorox 01625 7561 OR APPROVED EQUAL . S50 | Disinfectant | 6 canisters of | $6.00 per Disinfecting | . Clorox [ 75 wipe can/6 | $6.34 can
76700 [t AND 40 REQUIRED Wipes 80wipes  [container/36. Wipes Mfg. €1015949CT | canscase | $38.04 case
650880 00 per case #69075
Soap, Hand - Cartridge, Anti-Microbial Lotion Soap with
PCVIX in 800 m Cartridges, 12/box, Soap bag must be Purell Cs4 HC
W [individual cardboard boxes, Must Fit Golo dispenser Healthy Soap
- " NO BID NO BID
15| 76706 |#9034. Cartrdge dispensers included at no additional | < 3500 W/ Pemx 4case $66.25
Foam 1250m]
charge upon request, Inopak 5031-404, Y1700
|OR APPROVED EQUAL. SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED
Soap, Antibacterial, Hand Foaming, Cartridge 1000 ml, Highmark
CW-  |fragrance free. Cartridge dispensers included at no Antimicrobial
- NO BID NO BID
6| 76707 |additional charge upon request, Inopak 5064-FL1000, & 1500 F“’;: ﬁs‘:’a" 4fCase $5287
[OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED "
[Soap, Hand - Cartridge, Pink Lotion Soap in 800 ml GOJO® Pink
cw. |cartridees, 12/box, Soap bag must be individual 6010221708 &Klean
17| el0g [cardboard boxes, Must Fit Golo Dispenser #2230, cs 1000 NOBID o2 | 4/2000ML $58.50 Liquid skin | 12/Case $48.68
Inopak 5011-404, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND Cleanser
505 REQUIRFD Soan
Betco
CW-  |soap, Pink Lotion, 4/1 gallon, Inopak 5017-420, OR Winning Inopak 5011- $5.79 gal
g 9 . . NO BID - X
18 | 76710 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED on 20 Hands Pink 4fcase $3629 a00 | V8V 316 case
Lotion Skin
Cleanser
S0ap, Hand, Antibacterial Liquid, 4/1 gallon, Inopak
19 W-  [s031420, oR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND DS GAL 350 NOBID NOBID nopak SO31-| ool case [ 5733 E0!
7671 $29.32 case
REQUIRED
2 CW-  [Vomit Beads or Powder, 16 oz. jar, Hospico C5-8160, AR 250 NOBID NOBID NOBID
77875 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE AND SDS REQUIRED
cw. |Bleach, Household, 5.25%, packed 6-Gal/case, KIk KiK-pure
21| eoey |PURE BRIGHT, OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE AND cs 1200 NOBID NOBID eright | 6/1gal/ case |$247.18 case
505 REQUIRED KiKBleaché
| understand and ility to accept Credit Cards for
|on Page 9 - Section 45. (Yes or No) ves Yes ves
| What is the arrival time in days for the products you are bidding? 3-5 Days (if in stock) 15 Days 7-10 Business Days
What is the percentage discount off balance of line? 38% 20% o
55 Sheets (required when bidding Alternate ltems) Yes Yes Yes
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