THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Fastenal Company
Attn: Terry Owen/Christopher
Fornes
2001 Theurer Boulevard
Winona, MN 55987

Imperial Dade, LLC
Attn: R. Gregory
Rogers/Anthony Jeanty
21242 Meehan Ave
Port Charlotte, FL 33952

Office Depot, LLC
Attn: Tim LaBrie/Jim Pollman
6600 North Military Trail
Boca Raton, FL 33496-2434

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Paper Products for District Warehouse Operations (OWO) |Phone: (305) 755-4820 Phone: |(507) 454-5374 Phone: __ [(904) 509-0787 Phone: (561) 438-4800 Phone: (813) 621-6446
ITB NO. B207382JC
. eric.peabody@odpbusiness.com biddept@pyramidsp.com
THURSDAY,OCP)E::)I;LGT :,AZEEO @ 2:00 PM Email: Mvale@AllIFloridaPaper.{ Email: Eainesféai;es'::r‘\;ﬁ?om Email: ajeanty@imperialdade.com |Email: ulia.mendez@odpbusiness.com |Email: bonnie ramidsp.com
REVISED: July 5, 2024
DWO | PRODUCT DWO PRODUCT DWO DWO PRODUCT DWO
'LZM PSDL,:; DESCRIPTION Piggl:ﬁ:ﬂ:‘:f C‘:;L;EI("G DELIVERY | NAME AND C‘i&;ﬁé DELIVERY | NAME AND C‘:;L;EI("G DELIVERY Piggl:ﬁ:ﬂ:‘:f C‘:;L;EI("G DELIVERY NAME AND QTY PER CASE/PKG DELIVERY
- art No. PRICE | NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE PRICE NUMBER PRICE
Toilet Tissue, Standard, White Rolls, 4.4" X 3.8”, roll 454327 Boardwalk
diameter minimum 4.4, 1-Ply, 96 Rolls per Case, ESSITY TOILET BWK6170B 1000/Roll
1. | CW-77900 |[MUST BE PALLETIZED, SCA-TJ1636S, SCA-TJ1636S 96 $50.48 Discontinued 1516365 96 ROLLS 41.49 PAPER, 96800 $70.96 *Minimum 96 Roll 70'8 $54.99
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 1-PLY ROLL, order is 30 ors
Estimated Quantity 1000 WHT cases*
Toilet Tissue, Standard White, 4.0" x 3.75", 500 sheets Boardwalk
per roll, 2-Ply, Quilted, 96 Rolls per Case, SCA SCA2461200 ESSITY TISSZSIEEMZB‘,‘ATH BWK6180B 500/Roll
2. | CW-77901 |TM6120S, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE Replaced 80 $31.38 Discontinued vieies | 9B ROLLS | s36.54 WHT. 2Ly % $49.29 *Minimum o% $39.45
REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 3000 ym16120s 1 2-PLY, order is 35 96 Rolls/CS
96 ROLLS .
cases
Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 1- 592603
Ply 4000’ x 3.6", 3.3" Core SCA TJ1212A, OR . _ _ _ TISSUE
3. | CW-77902 APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED TJ1212A 6 $29.88 Discontinued Discontinued BATHROOM 6 $74.65 NO BID
Estimated Quantity 150 2pLY
Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, 9471082
White, 1-Ply, 2000’ x 3.6, 3.3” Core, SCA TJ0912A,
4. | CW-77903 |0R APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED TJO912A 12 $37.43 Discontinued Discontinued T(I_;SSSCUDE’J?;:I_H' 12 $43.65 NO BID
Estimated Quantity 200 3A45X’20001
Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, 411809
White, 2-Ply, 1000’ x 3.6, 3.3" Core, SCA TJ0922A, SCA TISSUE,
5. | CW-77904 [OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED TJ0922A 12 $32.27 Discontinued 12 $34.54 | BATHROOM, 12 $41.52 NO BID
N " TJ0922A
Estimated Quantity 800 1000SHT,
12CA
Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 2-
Ply 2000’ x 3.6", 3.3" Core SCA TJ1222A, . . . . . .
6. | CW-77905 | ) % DEROVED EQUAL. SAMPLE REQUIRED TJ1222A 6 $32.16 Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued NO BID
Estimated Quantity 600
Towels, Paper, Single Fold, 9.1 X 10.3", Natural, 4000 468780
per case, SK1850A, OR APPROVED EQUAL, N TORK TOWEL,
7. | CW-77909 |SAMPLE REQUIRED SK1850A 16 | $19.33 Discontinued SK1850A 40 $22.05 | SINGLE-FOLD, 40 $22.34 NO BID
. " 16CA,
Estimated Quantity 400 NATURAL
Towels, Paper, Multi fold, UNO BIDleached, 250
sheets per Package, 16 Packages per Case, MUST 468770
BE PALLETIZED, Cascades, SCA MK530E, . . ESSITY TOWELS,
8. | CW-77910 | 5% APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED RICSOE 16 | $18.59 Discontinued MK520A 40 $23.76 M-FOLD, 40 $22.07 NO BID
Estimated Quantity 16,000 NTRL, 4000CT
Towels, Paper, Rolls, 7.5 “ X 800", 1.8 Core, Packed 214719
six (6) per case, Natural, SCA RK800E, OR SCA TOWEL. ROLL
9. | CW-77911 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED RK80OE 6 $21.29 Discontinued haven 6 25.96 200 sion | © $28.05 NO BID
Estimated Quantity 1200 NATURAL
Towels, Paper, Rolls, 11" Perforated Sheets, PLEASE 694185
INCLUDE COMPLETE PRODUCT SPECS ATLAS TOWEL,
10. | CW-77913 |INCLUDING LENGTH OF ROLL AND CASE HB1990A 30 $25.55 Discontinued APuises | 30rolls | $1857 | PAPER 2-PLY, | 30 $33.31 NO BID
QUANTITY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 30RL/CA,
REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 1000 WHITE
Wipers, Paper, 9.75” X 16.75" Nylon Reinforced, Kimberly
White, 126 per Dispenser Box, Kimberly-Clark #34790, . ~ $63.93/10 Clark
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED ' Kimberly- | 4 5oy /126 ct [ 3161:20/ 10 | KIMBERLY- BXs ' #34790 126/Box, $66.98/10
M. | CW-77995 | Lo fed Quantity 250 No Bid Clark per Box BXs CLARK | 10boxes | ¢oooms No Bid “Minimum 10 Box/CS BXs
0616873 $16.128/BX 34790 FL Pref order is 250 $6.89/BX
cases”
12 ARO (Delivery Time in Days 5 days Within expected 30 day delivery timeline 30 days 5-7 Business Days 7-10 Days
13. BOL |Percentage discount off balance of line: Yes Yes at 30% off wholesale No Yes Yes (20%)

ITB TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. ITB NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON

REQUISITION(S).
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